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1.1 Introduction 

AECOM Technical Services, Inc. (AECOM) completed this Environmental Assessment (EA) on behalf of the 
United States Coast Guard (USCG).  The EA evaluates the potential environmental impacts associated with the 
proposed dredging of the boat basin and moorings at the Morale, Welfare, and Recreate (MWR) Boat Ramp at 
the USCG Base Elizabeth City in Pasquotank County, North Carolina.  The EA was performed in accordance 
with:  National Environmental Policy Act (NEPA) of 1969 (Section 102[2][c]), as implemented by the Council on 
Environmental Quality (CEQ) regulations (40 Code of Federal Regulations parts 1500-1508); Procedures for 
Considering Environmental Impacts (Department of Transportation 1979, rev. 1982, rev. 1985) Order 5610.1C; 
and USCG Policy NEPA: Implementing Procedures and Policy for Considering Environmental Impacts, 
COMDTINST M16475.1D (USCG, 2000).  NEPA requires the assessment of environmental consequences of 
Federal actions that may affect the quality of the human and natural environment.  Based on the potential for 
impacts described herein, the USCG will either publish a Finding of No Significant Impact (FONSI) or prepare an 
Environmental Impact Statement. 

The USCG Base Elizabeth City is located approximately 3.5 miles southeast of Elizabeth City, along Weeksville 
Road / Highway 344 (formerly Highway 34), on the south shore of the Pasquotank River in Pasquotank County, 
North Carolina (Figure 1).  The geographic location of the MWR Boat Ramp is latitude 36° 16’ 14.72” north and 
longitude 76° 10’ 40.31” west.  The MWR Boat Ramp can be approached by water from the northeast or by land 
via Moukawsher Drive along the shoreline.  Moukawsher Drive can be accessed from Consolidated Road on the 
south end of the Base.   

The MWR Boat Ramp is located on the north end of the Base’s shoreline, in a portion of the river tidal flats.  The 
MWR Boat Ramp consists of a two-lane concrete ramp with a concrete pavement approach and a launch dock 
centered in the boat ramp.  Rubble mound stone breakwaters project approximately 100 to 125 feet from the 
shoreline on both sides of the launch ramp to form a protected harbor area for launching and retrieving boats.  
Timber docks line both sides of the boat basin.  Mooring piles are in place along the west timber dock.  The MWR 
Boat Ramp is utilized by Base military personnel for launching privately-owned recreational boats, and for 
launching USCG vessels stationed at the Building 43 moorings.  Figure 2 is an aerial photograph of the boat 
ramp, boat basin, and moorings.  Photographs of the MWR Boat Ramp are included in Appendix A. 

1.2 Purpose and Need Statement 

The purpose of this project is to dredge the boat basin and moorings to a required depth below mean water level 
(MWL) at the MWR Boat Ramp due to changing conditions at the site.  Water depth in the boat basin and 
moorings is reduced by natural sediment deposition and by heavy winds from the north, which push water from 
the boat basin and down the Pasquotank River.  This wind effect decreases the depth of the water and hinders 
the USCG’s ability to utilize the boat ramp for both operational missions and recreational purposes.  According to 
the USCG personnel at Base Elizabeth City, the sustained winds can result in lowering water levels as much as 2 
to 3 feet.  Recent sounding data measured at the MWR Boat Ramp indicates that depth to sediment is as shallow 
as 4 feet MWL while the draft, the vertical distance between the waterline and the bottom of the hull, for the 
Response Boat-Small (RB-S) vessels is 3 feet 3 inches.  Together, these conditions create inadequate clearance 
depth for launching Special Purpose Craft (SPC) and RB-S vessels.  As a result, the USCG is routinely forced to 
launch their vessels at a public boat launch a number of miles upriver, which results in up to an hour delay for 
mission response.  The USCG proposes dredging the MWR Boat Ramp to a maximum depth of 8 feet below 
MWL.  MWL corresponds to elevation -0.44 North American Vertical Datum 1988 (NAVD88).  Therefore, dredging 
will proceed to -8.44 feet NAVD88.       

1 Project Justification 
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1.3 Alternatives Considered 

In order to provide the sufficient mooring depth for the MWR Boat Ramp, the following alternatives were 
considered and either dismissed or evaluated in this EA. 

1.3.1 Alternatives Considered and Dismissed 

Alternatives that would not allow the USCG Base Elizabeth City to safely use the boat launch and moorings were 
considered and dismissed because the operational missions of the USCG Base Elizabeth City could not be safely 
and efficiently executed.  Alternatives considered and dismissed included:  1) Acquiring alternative vessels that 
would require less clearance depth for launching was considered and dismissed because the USCG has no plans 
for such changes; 2) Discontinuing use of the MWR boat ramp as a boat launch for their search and rescue 
vessels and having to launch their vessels at a public boat launch several miles upriver was considered and 
dismissed because this results in up to an hour delay for mission response; 3) No longer allowing military 
personnel to use the boat ramp for recreational purposes was considered and dismissed because the boat ramp 
is used in conjunction with on-site cabins, mobile home units, recreational vehicle stations, and various other 
recreational facilities available to USCG personnel and their families; and, 4) Constructing a new boat ramp along 
the Base’s shoreline was considered and dismissed because this is not a feasible option due to the financial 
investment and that a new boat ramp would still need to be constructed along the shoreline of the Pasquotank 
River for the USCG’s use.  This would result in new dredge work in an undisturbed area, more significant and 
longer duration of impacts, and inevitably maintenance dredging will be required in the future.  Therefore, this is 
not a practical long-term solution.  

1.3.2 Alternatives Considered for Evaluation 

No Action:  This alternative would have the USCG continuing to use the boat basin and moorings in its current 
condition.   

Alternative A:  Dredge to a Maximum Depth of 8 Feet:  This alternative proposes mechanical dredging of 
accumulated sediment at the boat basin and moorings area to a target depth of 8 feet below MWL.  The MWR 
Boat Ramp is a previously dug man-made basin and the proposed dredging will occur entirely within the 
previously disturbed footprint of the boat basin and moorings.  However, the USCG has no record of the as-built 
drawings indicating the original dredge depth.  While the dredging required for the original construction of the 
MWR Boat Ramp likely disturbed the sediments to a depth proximate to the proposed dredge depth, the exact 
depth of the original dredging is not documented.  The dredging of the boat basin and moorings will remove 
sediment accumulated since the MWR Boat Ramp was initially constructed.  MWL corresponds to elevation -0.44 
NAVD88; therefore, dredging will proceed to -8.44 feet NAVD88.        

Approximately 755 cubic yards of sediment will be dredged from the boat basin and moorings.  During the 
proposed dredging activities, the dredge area will be closed with an impermeable floating turbidity curtain with a 
weighted bottom edge.  The dredge material will be deposited on barges, dewatered from the barge within the 
turbidity curtain, transported by barge to an unloading site, offloaded to trucks, and transported by truck to the 
licensed East Carolina Regional Landfill in Aulander, North Carolina for disposal.  Formal approval for disposal of 
the dredge material at the MWR Boat Ramp has been received from the East Carolina Regional Landfill.  Design 
drawings for the proposed alternative are in Appendix B.   

The proposed dredging project will only temporarily impact open waters (an area totaling approximately 0.18 
acres) and will occur entirely within the existing boat basin limits (limited to an area approximately 150 feet from 
the shoreline).   

1.4 Area of Potential Effect 

The area of potential effect (APE) includes both on-shore and off-shore portions of the MWR Boat Ramp (see 
Figure 2).  The APE also includes access roads to the MWR Boat Ramp and land transportation routes to the 
landfill.  The landfill where the sediment will be disposed of was included in the APE for evaluation of cultural 
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resources.  The landfill was not included in the evaluation of other impacts since the disposal of sediment at the 
landfill is consistent with the current and licensed use of the landfill. 
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This section evaluates the significance of environmental impacts of the proposed project on the physical, natural, 
socioeconomic, and cultural environment.  CEQ regulations (40 Code of Federal Regulations 1508.27) define 
“significance” in terms of the context of the action and the intensity of the impacts.  The context considers society 
as a whole, the affected region, the affected interests, and the locality.  The intensity of impact refers to the 
severity of an impact, and the following factors are considered:  

 Beneficial and adverse impacts 

 Public health and safety 

 Unique geological characteristics 

 Controversial nature of the action 

 Uncertain effects 

 Precedent-setting actions 

 Cumulative impacts 

 Historic landmark impacts 

 Impacts to endangered or threatened species or their habitat 

 Potential for violation of Federal, state, or local environmental standards 

The duration of the impacts are also considered.  Temporary impacts are reduced early in the project, short-term 
impacts occur during the life of the project and long-term impacts exist after project completion. 

2.1 Physical Environment 

2.1.1 Geology, Topography, and Soils 

Affected Environment:  The USCG Base Elizabeth City is situated on the south shore of the Pasquotank River, 
which connects to the Albemarle Sound, and is part of the Intercostal Waterway.  The MWR Boat Ramp is located 
on the north end of the base’s shoreline, in a portion of the river tidal flats.  Grain size analysis conducted on three 
sediment samples indicated that the sediment material consists of 4.4 to 6.8 percent fines (passing a # 200 
sieve).  Pasquotank County is located within the North Carolina Coastal Plain, and the geology of the area 
consists of undivided surficial deposits of sand, clay, and gravel of the Quaternary period.  According to the 
Natural Resources Conservation Service Soil Survey maps, the area immediately adjacent to the dredge area 
consists of Udorthents loamy soils on zero to two percent slopes. 

Anticipated Impacts:  The ‘no action’ alternative will have no impacts on the physical environment.  Proposed 
dredging of the MWR Boat Ramp will remove sediment from the boat basin and moorings to depths of up to 8 feet 
below MWL.  Potential impacts associated with soil erosion are not significant because land areas will not be 
disturbed outside of already developed areas, and dredged sediments will be deposited onto a barge prior to 
transport to an unloading site. 

2 Summary of Environmental Impacts 
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Mitigations and Conclusions:  The dredging of the area affects only sediment accumulated within the boat basin 
and mooring area due to natural deposition and lower water levels.  The dredging will not have significant impacts 
to the local geology and soils because of the small area and volume of sediment.  No mitigation is necessary. 

2.1.2 Climate and Air Quality 

Affected Environment:  Average temperatures in Elizabeth City range from a minimum of 31 degrees Fahrenheit 
in January to 89 degrees Fahrenheit in July.  The mean annual temperature is 61 degrees.  The area receives 
approximately 49 inches of precipitation a year.  According to the information from the State Climate Office of 
North Carolina, the average wind speed at the Coast Guard Air Field in Elizabeth City for 2014 was 8.9 miles per 
hour.  Pasquotank County has good air quality, with air quality index values below 50 since 1999.  An air quality 
index of 50 or below represents good air quality with little potential to affect public health. 

The United States Environmental Protection Agency (US EPA), under the requirements of the 1970 Clean Air Act 
as amended in 1977 and 1990, established primary and secondary standards for six airborne pollutants or criteria 
pollutants:  carbon monoxide, nitrogen dioxide, ozone, particulate matter, lead, and sulfur dioxide.  The primary 
standards, known as National Ambient Air Quality Standards (NAAQS), are intended to protect public health.  The 
secondary standards are intended to protect public welfare and account for air pollutant effects on soil, water, 
visibility, material, vegetation, and other aspects of general welfare.  The North Carolina ambient air quality 
standards include all of the NAAQS plus a standard for total suspended particulate matter and particulate matter 
with a diameter of ten microns or less.  For each pollutant, NAAQS has two designations:  attainment areas that 
meet the NAAQS and non-attainment areas that do not meet the NAAQS.  Currently, Pasquotank County is 
considered in attainment for the NAAQS and North Carolina Department of Environment and Natural Resources 
(NCDENR) Standards. 

Anticipated Impacts:  The ‘no action’ alternative will have no impacts on climate and air quality.  Emissions 
caused by dredging and transporting the sediment by truck are too minor to have a significant effect on climate or 
air quality currently present from area activities due to the brief work period (estimated two weeks) and small 
quantities of sediment removal (estimated 40 truckloads).  Future operation of the modified boat basin and 
moorings area would not contribute additional air emissions beyond current levels. 

Mitigations and Conclusions:  The dredging of the boat basin and moorings area will not have significant impacts 
to the local climate and air quality.  Therefore, no mitigation is necessary. 

2.1.3 Noise 

Affected Environment:  Existing noise levels in the vicinity of the MWR Boat Ramp are typical of those normally 
associated with nearby land uses, commercial and recreational vessels on the Pasquotank River, and USCG 
activities.  The primary sources of noise at the site are vehicular traffic, boat traffic on the river, aircraft traffic, 
wind, and waves.  These noises are loudest during daylight hours, during the summer tourist season, and during 
storms. 

Anticipated Impacts:  The ‘no action’ alternative will have no significant impacts on noise.  For the dredge 
alternative, heavy equipment and construction activity noises would result from dredging and transport of the 
dredged material to the landfill by barge and truck.  There are no residences within 1,500 feet of the project and 
truck traffic will be routed though commercial areas.  The noise from heavy equipment and construction activities 
would repel nearby fish, birds, and other wildlife.  Fish and wildlife would likely relocate to a nearby habitat when 
the dredging activities begin, and will likely return after these activities are completed.  These impacts are not 
significant because the noise will be consistent with other noise in the area and the dredging is short-term.   

Dredging is expected to occur during the normal operating hours at the site.  Noise is attenuated over distance 
according to the inverse square law, whereby each doubling of the distance, starting at 50 feet from the source, 
reduces the decibel level by 6 decibels.  Dredging activities are also considered a temporary intrusion of noise.  
The impact of the project on noise is not significant because the noise will be consistent with other sources of 
noise nearby, the noise will be short-term, and there are no nearby residences. 
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Mitigations and Conclusions:  During dredging activities, contractors should comply with all applicable federal and 
state laws on noise/hearing protection and abatement.  No additional mitigation measures are proposed. 

2.1.4 Hazardous Materials and Hazardous Waste 

Affected Environment:  Currently, the USCG Base Elizabeth City is identified as a Large Quantity Generator 
(LQG) of hazardous materials under Resource Conservation and Recovery Act regulations (US EPA ID No. 
NC2690308232).  A LQG generator is defined as any entity, other than a household, that generates 1,000 
kilograms (2,220 pounds) of hazardous waste or one (1) kilogram (2.2 pounds) of acutely hazardous waste per 
calendar month.  The types of wastes generated are consistent with the Base operations involving materials 
utilized in the maintenance of vehicles and boats, buildings and industrial activities including paints, paint 
removers, petroleum, oil, lubricants, greases, solvents, car and boat engine batteries, and fluorescent lamps.  
Hazardous and non-hazardous wastes are collected and stored at several satellite collection points.  Wastes 
including used oil (motor oil, lubricants, and grease); universal wastes (fluorescent lamps and used batteries); 
blast media, and paint waste.  A 90-day hazardous waste storage area is used to store collected materials prior to 
final off-site disposal.  

Anticipated Impacts:  There would be no anticipated impacts from the ‘no action’ alternative.  For the proposed 
dredging, the excavated sediment material is not characterized as a hazardous waste.  Fuel and other petroleum 
products contained within the dredging/construction equipment could be released during the onsite activities (via 
leaks or accidents).  However, these releases are not anticipated to be significant.   

Mitigations and Conclusions:  While releases from the dredging/construction equipment are not anticipated to be 
significant, the contractor should submit a spill prevention and response plan to the USCG covering all regulated 
materials brought to the project site.  The plan should indicate how the contractor would manage their petroleum 
storage and respond to petroleum releases, and to releases of any other regulated materials or substances 
brought to the project site.   

2.2 Natural Environment 

The site was inspected by an environmental scientist from AECOM on May 7, 2014.  A photographic log of the 
MWR Boat Ramp was completed during the survey and is included in Appendix A. 

2.2.1 Terrestrial Environment 

Affected Environment:  The USCG Base Elizabeth City is located in the coastal plain of northern North Carolina 
along the southern shore of the Pasquotank River, and the MWR Boat Ramp is located at the north end of the 
Base’s shoreline.  A large portion of the Base is covered in grass areas that are maintained by mowing, while the 
shoreline is predominantly developed with roadways, paved parking lots and buildings. 

Anticipated Impacts:  There would be no anticipated impacts from the ‘no action’ alternative.  For the proposed 
dredging, since the impacts are limited to the boat basin and moorings area, no impacts to the terrestrial 
environment are anticipated for this preferred alternative.   

Mitigations and Conclusions:  The dredging of the boat basin and moorings area will not have significant impacts 
to the terrestrial environment because no special terrestrial resources are present.  No mitigation is necessary. 

2.2.2 Water Resources and Aquatic Environment 

Affected Environment – Surface Water:  The USCG Base Elizabeth City is bordered to the east/northeast by the 
Pasquotank River.  Storm water from the developed portions of the Base flows to storm drain catch basins and 
drainage ditches, which discharge to the Pasquotank River.  Storm water runoff from undeveloped portions of the 
Base is allowed to infiltrate into the soils and allowed to naturally runoff via sheet flow into Pasquotank River. 

Anticipated Impacts:  There are no anticipated impacts from the ‘no action’ alternative.  Minor impacts to aquatic 
vegetation and water resources will occur from the dredging activities.  However, based on review of the North 
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Carolina OneMap Habitat Map, the project area is not located in the vicinity of a designated submerged aquatic 
vegetation area.  Additionally, no threatened and endangered aquatic plant species are recorded in the proposed 
project area.  It is anticipated that aquatic vegetation will become reestablished in the dredged area following the 
completion of the dredging activities.  Minor impacts to fish species will also occur from the dredging activities.  
According to the United States Fish and Wildlife Service (USFWS) species list for Pasquotank County and the 
North Carolina Natural Heritage Program (NC NHP) species list for the Elizabeth City quadrangle, two federally-
listed endangered species of fish (i.e., Shortnose sturgeon and Atlantic sturgeon) may be present in the proposed 
project area.  The fish in the area will temporarily move during the dredging activities.  It is anticipated that the fish 
will return to the area following the completion of the dredging activities.   

During dredging and dewatering activities, there is potential for sediment from the dredging area to be temporarily 
suspended in the water column of the Pasquotank River.  Since the project is confined to a small area, the extent 
of impact is anticipated to be limited to the immediate area of the dredging activities.   

Mitigation and Conclusions:  The sediment removal alternative is proposed to remove approximately 755 cubic 
yards of material.  The dredging will be performed from a floating plant and not from land based operations.  The 
sediment will be temporarily stored on a barge in the Pasquotank River for dewatering.  Best Management 
Practices (BMPs), such as an impermeable floating turbidity curtain, will be used to keep the sediments from 
leaving the dredging area and entering the main channel of the Pasquotank River.  The curtain will be a full depth 
floating design with weighted bottom edge, and it will remain in place in accordance with permit conditions or for a 
period of 48 hours after completion of dredging, whichever occurs longer.  The dredge material will be dewatered 
on the barge within the turbidity curtain.  The sediment material has been tested and characterized as non-
hazardous material; therefore, the proposed project will not cause the degradation of water quality.  Appropriate 
permits will be obtained for the discharge for the dewatering process, if required.  Other appropriate BMPs, such 
as controlling the rate of dredging, that are required by Clean Water Act permits will be used in the dredge area, 
as needed, to minimize the amount of silt that becomes suspended.  All water quality BMPs required by permits 
will be adhered to.  Additionally, to avoid potentially adverse impacts on life cycles of anadromous fish, the 
proposed project is expected to occur outside of the anadromous fish spawning moratorium (February 15 to June 
30).   

2.2.3 Floodplains and Costal Zone 

Affected Environment:  The dredging location is in the Pasquotank River and by definition is in the floodplain.  The 
project is also located in the Coastal Management Zone and within a North Carolina Division of Coastal 
Management (NC DCM) area of environmental concern. 

Anticipated Impacts:  The ‘no action’ alternative will have no impacts to floodplains and the coastal zone.  The 
USCG determined that the project is consistent with the Coastal Zone Management Act (CZMA) and North 
Carolina’s Coastal Zone Management Program (CZMP).  AECOM, on behalf of the USCG, prepared and 
submitted a Federal Consistency Determination (see documentation in Appendix C) to the NC DCM on January 
12, 2015.   In a letter dated March 19, 2015, the NC DCM concurred with the determination stating “DCM has 
reviewed the submitted information pursuant to the management objectives and enforceable policies of 
Subchapters 7H and 7M of Chapter 7 in Title 15A of the North Carolina Administrative Code and concurs that the 
proposed Federal activity by the US Coast Guard is consistent, to the maximum extent practicable, with North 
Carolina’s certified coastal management program.”  A copy of the NC DCM concurrence letter is included in 
Appendix C.   

Mitigations and Conclusions:  The dredging will not have significant impacts to floodplains, and no floodplain 
mitigation is necessary.  The project is consistent with the CZMA and North Carolina’s CZMP, and no mitigation is 
necessary. 

2.2.4 Wetlands 

Affected Environment:  Reviews of the USFWS National Wetlands Inventory Map and the North Carolina Coastal 
Wetlands Map were completed to determine the potential presence of wetlands.  The site was inspected to verify 
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the maps and to determine if any wetlands existed on the MWR Boat Ramp APE.  The USFWS National 
Wetlands Inventory Map did not identify wetlands in or near the project APE.  However, the northern and 
northwestern portions of the project APE as well as the remainder of the Pasquotank River are classified as 
Estuarine and Marine Deepwater (E1UBL) habitats.  The North Carolina Coastal Wetlands Map indicated that 
there are no coastal wetlands in or near the project APE.  No wetlands were observed during the inspection of the 
MWR Boat Ramp. 

Anticipated Impacts:  The ‘no action’ alternative will have no impacts on wetlands.  For the dredge alternative, no 
wetlands exist in the APE and there will be no wetland impacts. 

Mitigations and Conclusions:  Wetlands will not be affected and no mitigation is necessary. 

2.2.5 Prime and Unique Farmlands 

Affected Environment:  The Farmland Protection Policy Act (7 U.S.C. 4201, et seq.) is intended to preserve prime 
farmland for agricultural purposes whenever possible.  The project is located within the Pasquotank River, which 
is not prime or unique farmland. 

Anticipated Impacts:  The ‘no action’ alternative will have no impacts on prime and unique farmlands.  For the 
dredge alternative, no prime or unique farmlands exist in the dredge area or on-shore at the USCG Base 
Elizabeth City; therefore, there will be no impacts to prime or unique farmlands. 

Mitigations and Conclusions:  Prime and unique farmlands will not be affected and no mitigation is necessary. 

2.2.6 Threatened or Endangered Species 

Affected Environment:  A list of State and Federally-listed rare, threatened, and endangered species (TES) that 
are recorded from within the APE and/or surrounding area was obtained online from the USFWS Threatened and 
Endangered Species and Species of Concern for Pasquotank County and the NC NHP Heritage Data Search for 
the Elizabeth City Quadrangle.  Table 1 summarizes the TES recorded from the online searches.  The table also 
lists the species status, habitat requirements, and if the habitat is present at the project site.  In addition, a NC 
NHP Information Request on the distribution of State-listed TES, a USFWS Section 7 Consultation Request for 
Federally-listed TES, and a National Marine Fisheries Service (NMFS) Section 7 Consultation Request for the 
sturgeon species were completed by AECOM (see documentation in Appendix D).  At the time this report was 
prepared, a response had not been received from the NMFS. 

Table 1 – Summary of Records of Federal and State Rare, Threatened, and Endangered Species 

Species (1, 2) 
State 

Status 
(1) 

Federal 
Status 

(2) 
Habitat (1, 2) 

Habitat 
Present 

Bald Eagle   
(Haliaeetus 
leucocephalus) 

T BGPA 
Mature forests near large bodies of water (for nesting); 
lakes and sounds (for foraging)  Yes 

Red Knot 
(Calidris canutus rufa) 

- P 
Migration stops along the Atlantic coast; principally found 
in marine and estuarine habitats; main food source is 
horseshoe crab eggs 

Yes 

Shortnose Sturgeon 
(Acipenser brevirostrum) 

E E 

Anadromous species that prefers near shore marine, 
estuarine, and riverine habitat of large river systems; 
migrate periodically into faster moving fresh water areas to 
spawn 

Yes 

Atlantic Sturgeon 
(Acipenser oxyrinchus) 

SC E 

Anadromous species; migrate from estuarine and marine 
waters into freshwater in the spring and early summer to 
spawn; spawn in moderately flowing water in deep parts of 
large rivers; sub adults and adults live in coastal waters 
and estuaries 

Yes 



AECOM   2-6 

 

J:\Projects\U\US Coast Guard 2013 Contract\Elizabeth City, NC\Sediment 
Sampling and EA\500 Deliverables\506 Reports\EA_MWR Boat 
Ramp\EA\MWR Boat Ramp_EA_FINAL DRAFT_04-07-15.docx 

                                                                                         April 2015 

 

Species (1, 2) 
State 

Status 
(1) 

Federal 
Status 

(2) 
Habitat (1, 2) 

Habitat 
Present 

American Eel  
(Anguilla rostrate) 

- FSC 

Catadromous species; mature eels migrate from brackish 
and freshwater habitats in streams, large rivers, and 
estuaries to the ocean to spawn. Larvae develop in the 
ocean and the eel migrates upstream to estuaries and 
freshwater habitats as it matures 

Yes 

West Indian Manatee 
(Trichechus manatus) 

- E 
Warm waters of estuaries and river mouths Yes 

Grassleaf Arrowhead 
(Sagittaria weatherbiana) 

- FSC 
Fresh or brackish marshes, stream banks, and wet 
depressions 

No 

White Doll’s-daisy 
(Boltonia asteroides var. 
glastifolia) 

SR-O - 
Clay-based Carolina bays, marshes, savannas 

No 

Slender Blue Iris 
(Iris prismatica) 

SR-T - 
Bogs, marshes, and wet powerline clearings 

No 

Winged Seedbox 
(Ludwigia alata) 

SR-P - Interdune ponds, marshes No 

State Status: Federal Status: 

E = Endangered E = Endangered 

T = Threatened T = Threatened 

SC = Special Concern FSC = Federal Species of Concern 

SR-O = Significantly Rare – Other BGPA = Bald and Golden Eagle Protection Act 

SR-P = Significantly Rare - Peripheral P = Proposed 

SR-T = Significantly Rare - Throughout -  = Not listed by USFWS in Pasquotank County 

-  = Not listed by NC NHP in Elizabeth City quad N/A = Not Applicable 

N/A = Not Applicable  

(1)  Source: North Carolina Natural Heritage Program, Heritage Data Search (accessed September and November 2014) at 
http://www.ncnhp.org/web/nhp/database-search.  State Listed species are terrestrial and aquatic species within approximately one mile of the site.     

(2)  Source: U.S. Fish and Wildlife Service, Endangered Species, Threatened Species, Federal Species of Concern, and Candidate Species for Pasquotank 
County (accessed online September and November 2014) at http://www.fws.gov/raleigh/species/cntylist/pasquotank.html 

Anticipated Impacts:  The ‘no action’ alternative will have no impacts on threatened or endangered species.  
Based on site observations and habitat requirements, there is a potential for listed species protected under the 
Endangered Species Act to be impacted by the proposed action under the dredge alternative (i.e., Shortnose 
sturgeon and Atlantic sturgeon).  The USFWS Section 7 determination concluded that the preferred alternative to 
dredge the boat basin and moorings “is not likely to adversely affect any federally-listed endangered or threatened 
species, their formally designated critical habitat, or species currently proposed for listing.”   

However, the USFWS response recommended the following actions to mitigate impacts to aquatic resources: 

 “[T]he Service is concerned about the potential impacts the proposed action might have on aquatic species.  
Aquatic resources are highly susceptible to sedimentation.  Therefore, we recommend that all practicable 
measures be taken to avoid adverse impacts to aquatic species, including implementing directional boring 
methods and stringent sediment and erosion control measures.  An erosion and sedimentation control plan 
should be submitted to and approved by the North Carolina Division of Land Resources, Land Quality Section 
prior to construction.  Erosion and sedimentation controls should be installed and maintained between the 
construction site and any nearby down-gradient surface waters.  In addition, we recommend maintaining 
natural, vegetated buffers on all streams and creeks adjacent to the project site.”   

The NC NHP responded to USCG’s request letter the “NC NHP database does not show any records for rare 
species, important natural communities, natural areas, or conservation/managed areas within the proposed 
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project area.”  However, the NC NHP database shows element occurrence records for the Shortnose sturgeon, 
Atlantic sturgeon, and Slender Blue Iris within one mile of the project site.  The element occurrence records for 
Shortnose sturgeon and Atlantic sturgeon “are located in Albemarle Sound and North Carolina coastal waters 
(including Albemarle Sound), respectively.”  The element “occurrence record for Slender Blue Iris is from Hogs 
Creek in Pasquotank County.”  Impacts to the remaining State-listed species are not anticipated because suitable 
habitat is not present in the APE.    

Mitigation and Conclusions:  To avoid potentially adverse impacts on life cycles of anadromous fish (i.e., 
Shortnose sturgeon and Atlantic sturgeon), the proposed project will occur outside of the anadromous fish 
spawning moratorium (February 15 to June 30).  Additionally, to avoid potential impacts to aquatic species, an 
impermeable floating turbidity curtain with a weighted bottom edge will be used to keep the sediments from 
leaving the dredging area and entering the main channel of the Pasquotank River.  AECOM contacted the North 
Carolina Division of Land Resources, Land Quality Section to inquire about submitting an erosion and 
sedimentation control plan for the proposed project.  The North Carolina Division of Land Resources, Land 
Quality Section stated that since the only work on-shore will be the loading of dredged material into trucks for 
transport to the landfill, which is not anticipated to disturb more than one acre of land, a state-approved erosion 
and sedimentation control plan is not required.  However, erosion and sediment controls will be installed and 
maintained between the off-loading site and nearby down-gradient surface waters by the contractor.  

2.3 Socioeconomic Environment 

2.3.1 Land Use and Zoning 

Affected Land Use and Development Environment:  The USCG Base Elizabeth City is located approximately 3.5 
miles southeast of Elizabeth City, along Weeksville Road / Highway 344 (formerly Highway 34), in Pasquotank 
County, North Carolina. Land records indicate that the Base sits on an approximately 748-acre parcel, owned by 
the USCG.  The Base is located on the south shore of the Pasquotank River, which connects to the Albemarle 
Sound and is part of the Intracoastal Waterway.  The MWR Boat Ramp is located on the north end of the Base’s 
shoreline, in a portion of river tidal flats.  The Base can be accessed either from the main gate off Weeksville 
Road on the north end of the Base, or from a second entrance off Consolidated Road on the south end of the 
Base.  The MWR Boat Ramp can be approached by water from the northeast or by land via Moukawsher Drive 
along the shoreline.   

The USCG Base Elizabeth City is classified as “Institutional & Public” in recent (December 2011) Pasquotank 
County land use plans.  The surrounding areas to the west, south, and southeast are classified as “Agricultural”; 
small areas classified as “Forestry” and “Commercial” are also present to the west and south.  The area to the 
north-northwest of the Base is classified as “Elizabeth City Planning Jurisdiction.”  The Elizabeth City land use 
plan (December 2011) depicts the area to the north-northwest of the Base as “Undeveloped,” “Low Density 
Residential,” “High Density Residential,” and “Public & Institutional”.   

Anticipated Impacts:  The ‘no action’ alternative will have no impacts land use and zoning.  The proposed depth 
improvements for the MWR Boat Ramp will not affect land use, zoning, existing or future development patterns, or 
city-approved land use and development plans because there will be no changes in land use.  

Mitigations and Conclusions:  The project will not affect land use and zoning.  No mitigation is necessary.  

2.3.2 Socioeconomic Environment 

Affected Environment:  The USCG Base Elizabeth City is located in Pasquotank County, North Carolina.  
According to United States Census Bureau data, the county supported a population of 39,981 residents in 2013, 
with a median age of 36.3 (2008-2012) and a mean household income of $60,713 (2008-2012).  The County 
racial mix in 2013 was estimated at about 58.1 percent white and 37.8 percent black or African American, with 
about 4.4 percent of Hispanic origin.   

According to the 2008-2012 American Community Survey 5-Year Estimates, the unemployment rate in 
Pasquotank County was 8.1 percent, which is above the statewide average of 6.6 percent.  Educational, health 
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care, and social assistance services accounts for 28.5 percent of all jobs in the county, which is above the 
statewide average of 23.4 percent.  The county also supports retail trade (12.6 percent); arts, entertainment and 
recreation, and accommodation and food services (10.1 percent); construction (6.9 percent); and manufacturing 
(6.6 percent).  

Anticipated Impacts:  The ‘no action’ alternative will have no impacts on the socioeconomic environment.  The 
proposed depth improvements are not expected to have a material impact (adverse or otherwise) on the existing 
socio-economic environment.  In total, it is anticipated that statistics reflective of the current socio-economic 
condition of Elizabeth City and Pasquotank County will be unchanged by the proposed alternative.   

Mitigations and Conclusions:  The project will not affect the socioeconomic environment and no mitigation is 
necessary.  

2.3.3 Community 

Affected Environment:  The USCG Base Elizabeth City was built in 1940 and consists of over 100 buildings which 
have been constructed over the lifetime of the Base.  The Base is the largest USCG Air Station in the nation, and 
contains a number of commands including Air Station Elizabeth City, Aircraft Repair and Supply Center, Aviation 
Technical Training Center, Support Center Elizabeth City, and Small Boat Station Elizabeth City.  Base Elizabeth 
City provides a variety of mission support services to units and personnel, including administration and personnel 
management, health care services, supply, procurement and warehousing, industrial services, facilities 
maintenance, computer/electronics support as well as morale and recreational services.  Base Elizabeth City 
coordinates and provides regional mission support activities within the Coast Guard Fifth Coast District.  Since 
1995 the Air Station has averaged over 360 search and rescue missions each year.    

Anticipated Impacts:  Given the apparent need for dredging, the ‘no action’ alternative would be expected to have 
an impact on the community.  During wind-induced periods of low water and due to sediment deposition, there is 
inadequate clearance depth at the MWR Boat Ramp for launching USCG SPC and RB-S vessels.  As a result, 
the USCG is routinely forced to launch their vessels at a public boat launch a number of miles upriver, which 
results in up to an hour delay for mission response. 

The dredging activities proposed at the MWR Boat Ramp are not expected to have long-term adverse impact on 
the existing community.  Short-term impacts, including removal of dredge material by barge and truck, would be 
localized and are not anticipated to be significant.  Construction activity will be similar to any construction project 
in the area.  Any damage that occurred to the roads as a result of the project would be repaired by the contractor 
conducting the work. 

Mitigations and Conclusions:  Construction activities should be limited to normal working hours.  Truck traffic will 
be along existing public and government owned roadways.  With these standard mitigation measures the project 
should have minimal to no impact on the community.   

2.3.4 Infrastructure/Utilities 

Affected Environment:  Entry to the Base can be gained from either Weeksville Road through the main gate on 
the north end of the Base, or from Consolidated Road through the secondary gate on the south end of the Base.  
Access to the MWR Boat Ramp, located on the north end of the Base’s shoreline, is via Moukawsher Drive along 
the shoreline.  The access roads to and from the Base are improved (concrete/asphalt).  Utilities associated with 
the MWR Boat Ramp include a storm sewer outfall west of, and outside the west rubble mound breakwater (not 
within the protected harbor area) and underground electric.  The utilities associated with the MWR Boat Ramp are 
remotely located from the proposed dredging area. 

Anticipated Impacts:  The ‘no action’ alternative will have no impacts on infrastructure or utilities.  The proposed 
project will have no adverse impact on existing, operational infrastructure, or utilities.  Underground utilities will be 
identified and avoided or restored after dredging.  Existing roads between the site and the East Carolina Regional 
Landfill (1922 Republican Road, Aulander, Bertie County, North Carolina) are capable of supporting heavier truck 
traffic for disposal of the dredged material as long as the contracted hauler adheres to the State load limits 
(80,000 pounds for four or more axles).  Any impacts from trucking will be minimal and short-term. 
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Mitigations and Conclusions:  The project will not affect infrastructure.  No mitigation other than standard 
construction practices to identify, avoid, and restore infrastructure is necessary. 

2.3.5 Public Service/Public Health and Safety 

Affected Environment:  The North Carolina Wildlife Resources Commission (NC WRC) tracks information on 
boating safety, including accidents and fatalities.  For 2013, state reports indicated that about 50 boating 
accidents occurred per 100,000 registered boats, up slightly from 2012 levels (48.79 accidents per 100,000 
registered boats).  Fatal boating accidents were down slightly since 2012, decreasing from 7.43 to 5.58 fatal 
accidents per 100,000 registered boats.  Clearly, the ability of USCG personnel to perform their work and achieve 
their mission is dependent on their ready access to all available seaworthy vessels, with harbors and moorings of 
sufficient depth to support mission requirements.  Other public safety (fire, police, health care) are provided by the 
City and local hospitals.  

Anticipated Impacts:  The ‘no action’ alternative will have adverse impacts on public service, health, and safety 
because the ability of the USCG to carry out search and rescue missions from the USCG Base Elizabeth City will 
be impaired by shallow water at the boat basin and moorings.  The proposed depth improvements will facilitate 
USCG operations, and these operations promote public service, health and safety.  The proposed dredging will 
not affect local fire, police, and health care services.  

Mitigations and Conclusions:  The project will have no adverse impacts to public service, health and safety.  No 
mitigation is necessary. 

2.3.6 Recreational Resources 

Affected Environment:  According to the NC WRC, the number of boats registered in-state has steadily decreased 
from 2009 to 2013, decreasing from 368,004 to 304,658.  For Pasquotank County, the number of registered boats 
has decreased proportionally from 2,033 boats in 2009 to 1,707 registered boats in 2013. 

Anticipated Impacts:  Under the ‘no action’ alternative USCG response times might increase if alternative harbor 
facilities are required, which could impact recreational use.  Additionally, the MWR Boat Ramp is used by Base 
military personnel for launching privately-owned recreational boats.  The ‘no action’ alternative will also have 
adverse impacts on recreational use of the boat ramp by military personnel.  The proposed depth improvements 
will not adversely impact recreational resources, but rather have a positive effect.   

Mitigations and Conclusions:  The project will not adversely affect recreational resources and no mitigation is 
necessary.  

2.3.7 Environmental Justice 

Affected Environment:  Federal guidance indicates that environmental justice concerns may arise from impacts on 
the natural and physical environment, such as human health or ecological impacts on minority populations, low-
income populations, and Native American tribes, or from related social or economic impacts.  According to the 
United States Census Bureau data for Elizabeth City, the estimated 2013 population was 18,266 residents with a 
median age of 31 years and a racial makeup that is less diverse than the county or state as a whole.  Racial 
breakdowns for 2010 identified a 0.4 percent Native American presence in Elizabeth City, which is less than the 
county or state as a whole.  

US EPA records were evaluated using the Environmental Justice View web-tool.  According to the web-tool, the 
nearest Superfund sites are located in Portsmouth and Suffolk, Virginia, and the nearest Brownfield sites are 
located in Hampton, Virginia and Williamston, North Carolina.     

The dredging operation itself would only be expected to generate short-term impacts, related to noise and truck 
activity.  With roads in close proximity to the site, trucks will not need to navigate through residential areas to 
reach disposal sites. 
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Anticipated Impacts:  The ‘no action’ alternative will have no impacts on environmental justice.  The proposed 
project will have no adverse impact on any potential environmental justice area as this concept is currently 
applied. 

Mitigations and Conclusions:  The project will not affect environmental justice and no mitigation is necessary.   

2.4 Cultural Resources 

Section 106 of the National Historic Preservation Act requires that impacts from federal undertakings on 
archaeological and architectural resources (i.e., cultural resources) that are listed or have been determined 
eligible for listing in the National Register of Historic Places in the APE, be taken into account in project planning.  
If adverse effects result, Section 106 requires that mitigation measures mutually agreeable to the lead agency and 
the relevant State Historic Preservation Office (SHPO) be implemented.  The USCG provided a project-specific 
informational letter to the North Carolina SHPO dated July 18, 2014 that summarized the results of a literature 
search and background review of recorded cultural resources for the proposed actions at the USCG Base 
Elizabeth City, requesting their concurrence with the findings.   

2.4.1 Prehistoric and Historic Context 

Affected Environment: 

Archaeological Resources:  No archaeological investigations have been completed in the APE.  There are no 
National Register-listed or -eligible, or potentially eligible (according to the SHPO Study List) terrestrial or 
underwater archaeological sites located within or immediately adjacent to the APE.  No shipwrecks have been 
recorded in the MWR boat ramp and moorings APE and no historic properties have been recorded at the East 
Carolina Regional Landfill.  

Architectural Resources:  No historic architectural surveys have been completed in the APE.  There are no 
historic architectural resources located within or immediately adjacent to the APE.  Three historic architectural 
resources have been identified within one mile of the APE, including one site that has been Determined Eligible 
and two potentially eligible sites on the SHPO Study List.  The Thrun Hall Barracks is a site that has been 
determined National Register-eligible in 2010 and is located inland from the MWR Boat Ramp, approximately 
three-quarters of a mile to the southeast of the APE.  The Thrun Hall Barracks were subsequently photo 
documented and demolished upon the SHPO’s approval.  The John Hollowell House (PK0972) and the C.W. 
Hollowell House (PK0474) are on the Study List and are located inland from the MWR Boat Ramp, approximately 
one mile to the south-southwest of the APE. 

Anticipated Impacts:  The ‘no action’ alternative will have no impacts on cultural resources.  In a letter dated 
August 19, 2014, the North Carolina SHPO concurred with AECOM’s findings, stating “We have conducted a 
review of the project and are aware of no historic resources which would be affected by the project.  Therefore, 
we have no comment on the project as proposed.”  The consultation letter submitted by AECOM and the North 
Carolina SHPO concurrence letter are included in Appendix E. 

Mitigations and Conclusions:  No cultural or historic resources will be affected by this project and no mitigation is 
necessary.   

2.5 Summary of Potential Impacts 

A summary of the potential impacts is presented in Table 2.   

Table 2 - Summary of Potential Environmental Impacts 

Potential Impacts 
No Action 
Alternative 

Dredging Boat Basin and Moorings at MWR Boat Ramp 
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Potential Impacts 
No Action 
Alternative 

Dredging Boat Basin and Moorings at MWR Boat Ramp 

Geology, Topography, Soils None 

Not significant.  Approximately 755 cubic yards of sediment will be 
removed from the boat basin and mooring at the MWR Boat 
Ramp launch area.  The sediment will be disposed of at a 
licensed landfill (East Carolina Regional Landfill). 

Climate and Air Quality None 
Not significant.  There will be minor and short-term emissions from 
dredging equipment and trucks similar to any construction project.  

Noise None 
Not significant.  Short-term impacts to commercial areas and 
nearby residences.  Wildlife will likely relocate to a nearby habitat 
during the dredging.   

Hazardous Materials None 
Not significant.  Short-term potential accidental releases from 
construction equipment will be effectively mitigated by 
requirement for contractor’s spill prevention and response plan. 

Terrestrial Environment None 
Not significant.  No changes proposed.  Short-term construction 
staging limited to USCG property paved parking areas.     

Water Resources and Aquatic 
Environment 

None 

Not significant.  Short-term and local minor disturbance of benthic 
habitat.  Sediment re-suspension and transport will be effectively 
mitigated by construction practices and BMPs.  The dredge 
material will be dewatered on the barge within the turbidity curtain.   
The sediment material has been tested and characterized as non-
hazardous material; therefore, the proposed project will not cause 
the degradation of water quality.  

Floodplains and Coastal Zone None 
Not significant.  Minor increase in flood storage.  The proposed 
project is consistent with the CZMA and North Carolina’s CZMP. 

Wetlands None No impact.  Wetlands not present. 

Prime and Unique Farmlands None No impact.  Farmland not present. 

Threatened or Endangered Species None 

Not significant.  Short-term and local minor impact to aquatic 
habitat.  Threatened or endangered species present within the 
project APE (i.e., Atlantic sturgeon and Shortnose sturgeon) will 
likely relocate to nearby habitat during the dredging, and dredging 
will not be performed during the moratorium.  The USFWS 
Section 7 determination concluded that the preferred alternative to 
dredge the boat basin and moorings “is not likely to adversely 
affect any federally-listed endangered or threatened species, their 
formally designated critical habitat, or species currently proposed 
for listing.     
 

Land Use and Zoning None No impact.  No change in land use or zoning. 

Socioeconomic Environment None No impact.   

Community None 
Not significant.  Short-term increase in truck traffic through 
commercial areas consistent with current traffic.   
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The dredging of the boat basin and moorings, to an 8-foot depth below MWL, is required to support the USCG 
Base Elizabeth City and its missions.  The missions include search and rescue, environmental protection, and law 
enforcement.  These missions are essential to public safety, recreational vessels, and commercial navigation. 

Any impacts from the proposed dredging to the terrestrial, aquatic, and human environment would be localized 
and temporary and are not significant. 

 

3 Statement of Environmental Significance 
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During construction activities, contractors should comply with all applicable federal and state laws on 
noise/hearing protection and abatement.  Construction is expected to occur during the normal operating hours at 
the USCG Base Elizabeth City.  Standard construction practices to identify, avoid, and restore infrastructure 
should be implemented.  Truck traffic will be routed along existing roadways to the licensed East Carolina 
Regional Landfill in Aulander, North Carolina for disposal.  Formal approval for disposal of the dredge material at 
the MWR Boat Ramp has been received from the landfill.  Truckloads will be covered prior to transport and 
dredge material will be required to pass a paint filter test prior to disposal and landfill acceptance.  To ensure the 
proposed dredge depth is not exceeded, pre- and post-dredge soundings will be taken by a registered surveyor to 
verify the sediment depth.  

The dredging contractor will submit a spill prevention and response plan to the USCG covering all regulated 
materials brought to the project site.  The plan will indicate how the contractor will manage their petroleum storage 
and respond to petroleum releases, and to releases of any other regulated materials or substances brought to the 
project site.  The contractor will complete a daily report for each day of the onsite dredging activities.  The daily 
report will document the weather; work hours; work in-place; inspections and tests conducted, and their results; 
dimensional checks; equipment and material checks; the mobilization and demobilization of construction 
equipment; materials delivered to the site; and any other pertinent noteworthy event.     

The dredging will be performed from a floating plant and not from land based operations.  BMPs, such as an 
impermeable floating turbidity curtain, will be used to keep the sediments from leaving the dredging area and 
entering the main channel of the Pasquotank River.  The dredge material will be dewatered on the barge within 
the turbidity curtain.  Appropriate permits will be obtained for the discharge for the dewatering process, if required.  
Other appropriate BMPs, such as controlling the rate of dredging, that are required by Clean Water Act permits 
will be used in the dredge area, as needed, to minimize the amount of silt that becomes suspended and 
transported downstream.  All water quality BMPs required by permits will be adhered to.   

Since the only work on-shore will be the loading of dredged material into trucks for transport to the landfill, which 
is not anticipated to disturb more than one acre of land, a state-approved erosion and sedimentation control plan 
is not required.  However, erosion and sediment controls will be installed and maintained between the off-loading 
site and nearby down-gradient surface waters by the contractor.  Additionally, to avoid potentially adverse impacts 
on life cycles of anadromous fish, the proposed project will occur outside of the anadromous fish spawning 
moratorium (February 15 to June 30).  Required permit(s) may also specify BMPs or mitigation measures.  
Contractors will be required to comply with these permit conditions. 

 

 

 

4 Summary of Mitigations 
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The CZMA requires that Federal agency activity within or outside the coastal zone that affects any land or water 
use or natural resource of the coastal zone shall be carried out in a manner which is consistent to the maximum 
extent practicable with the enforceable policies of the approved State management programs.  The preferred 
alternative, dredging the boat basin and existing moorings is not anticipated to adversely affect the coastal zone 
resources of North Carolina’s CZMP other than as evaluated elsewhere within this EA.  AECOM prepared a 
Federal Consistency Determination, which was submitted on January 12, 2015, seeking concurrence from the NC 
DCM.  A copy of the NC DCM concurrence letter (Consistency Determination #CD15-004; NC DCM Project 
#20150003) is included in Appendix C. Compliance with applicable federal environmental regulatory 
requirements and Executive Orders pertaining to air, water, noise, biota, floodplains, wetlands, coastal zone, 
waste management, transportation, and cultural and historic resources, etc. is a requirement of contractors 
working on this project, which have been discussed and presented in this EA.  In addition, AECOM, on behalf of 
the USCG, completed a Joint United States Army Corps of Engineers (USACE) and North Carolina Division of 
Water Resources (NC DWQ) Pre-Construction Notification (PCN) Application.  A copy of the PCN Application is 
included in Appendix F.  A response letter from the NC DWQ (Request for Additional Information; NC DWQ 
Project # 14-1039) is included in Appendix F.  At the time this report was prepared, the actual permits had not 
been received from the regulatory agencies (USACE and NC DWQ) because the agencies declined to process 
the joint permit application until this Draft EA is published.    

AECOM, on behalf of the USCG, submitted a special waste profile and laboratory analytical data to Republic 
Services and was approved by the East Carolina Regional Landfill to dispose of the dredge material from the 
project at the existing landfill.  A copy of the Special Waste Department Decision is included in Appendix F. 

The project will not affect state-designated environmental areas or wetlands.  The project will not affect historic or 
cultural resources. 

 

 

 

 

5 Regulatory Requirements 
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During the preparation of this EA, several federal, state, and local agencies and organizations were consulted.  In 
addition to consultation letters discussed in this EA, the USCG will submit this Draft EA to the state and federal 
agencies and organizations consulted during its completion for review.  In addition, copies of the Draft report will 
be made available to the local community for review at the East Albemarle Regional Library, Pasquotank County 
Branch.  A notice will be placed in the Daily Advance to inform the community about the availability of the Draft 
EA.  Coordinating agencies and the public will be provided a 30-day review period and encouraged to provide 
comments. 

After receiving and considering all comments on this Draft EA from the public and coordinating agencies, the 
USCG will issue a Final EA and, if applicable, a Finding No Significant Impact (FONSI).  As provided by NEPA 
and as referenced in COMDTINST M16475.1D, the FONSI for the preferred alternative will be made available to 
the public for a period of not less than 30 days before the final determination is made and the action is 
implemented.  Any necessary consultations and permits will be conducted and obtained during this period.  No 
on-site activities related to the preferred alternative will be initiated until the environmental review process has 
been completed. 

 

6 Public Involvement 
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Two alternatives were considered for evaluation in this Draft EA:  no action and dredging to a depth of 8 feet 
below MWL.  The Draft EA was performed in accordance with NEPA, Procedures for Considering Environmental 
Impacts (Department of Transportation 1979, rev. 1982, rev. 1985) Order 5610.1C, and COMDTINST 
M16475.1D.  

Based on the results presented in this Draft EA, the preferred alternative is dredging sediment to a depth of 8 feet 
below MWL and transporting the sediment via truck for disposal at a licensed landfill.  The potential adverse 
environmental impacts presented during this evaluation can either be prevented or reduced to insignificant levels 
using the mitigation measures presented in this Draft EA.  The results of this Draft EA indicate that 
implementation of the proposed action will not cause significant changes in the quality of the human and natural 
environment, supporting a preliminary FONSI. 

 

7 Conclusion 
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Ms. Allison Weakley, NCDENR, North Carolina Office of Land and Water Stewardship, North Carolina Natural 
Heritage Program, 1601 Mail Service Center, Raleigh, North Carolina 27699 

Ms. Anne Deaton, North Carolina Division of Marine Fisheries, Habitat Protection Section, 3441 Arendell Street, 
Morehead City, North Carolina 28557 

Mr. Daniel Govoni, Federal Consistency Coordinator, NC DCM, 400 Commerce Avenue, Morehead City, North 
Carolina 28557 

Mr. Josh Pelletier, USACE, Washington Regulatory Field Office, 2407 W. 5th Street, Washington, North Carolina 
27889 

Ms. Maria Dunn, NC WRC, 1721 Mail Service Center, Raleigh, North Carolina 27699 

Mr. Patrick McClain, North Carolina Division of Land Resources, Land Quality Section, Washington Region, 943 
Washington Square Mall, Washington, North Carolina 27889 

Mr. Pete Benjamin, USFWS, Raleigh Field Office, Post Office Box 33726, Raleigh, North Carolina 27636 

Ms. Renee Gledhill-Earley, North Carolina Department of Cultural Resources, State Historic Preservation Office, 
4617 Mail Service Center, Raleigh, North Carolina 27699 

Mr. Robert Tankard, North Carolina Division of Water Resources, Water Quality Regional Operations Section, 
943 Washington Square Mall, Washington, North Carolina 27889 

 

8 Persons and Agencies Contacted 
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Appendix A.  
 
Photographic Survey Log 
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MWR Boat Ramp – USCG Base Elizabeth City, NC 
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North 

Description: 
 
View from the southern 
side of the shore 
(concrete pavement 
approach) of the concrete 
ramp, docks, navigation 
aids, and light pedestals. 
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Appendix C.  
 
Coastal Zone Federal Consistency 
Determination 



U.S. Department of 
Homeland Security 

United States 
Coast Guard 

Dan GovoFederal Consistency Coordinator 

Commanding Officer 
United States Coast Guard 
Civil Engineering Unit Cleveland 

North Carolina Division of Coastal Management 
400 Commerce Avenue 
Morehead City, NC 28557-3421 

Dear Mr. Govani: 

1240 East Ninth Street 
Room 2179 
Cleveland Ohio 44199-2060 
Staff Symbol: ER 
Phone: (216) 902·6219 
Fax: (216) 902·6277 
Email: Gregory.O.Carpenter@uscg.mil 

11000 

In accordance with the federal consistency requirements ofthe Coastal Zone Management Act, 
16 USC § 1456, and applicable regulations, 15 CFR § 930.36, the United States Coast Guard 
(USCG) is submitting this ocorrespondence to fulfill State agency coordination requirements. The 
USCG proposes to complete maintenance dredging of the boat basin and moorings at the Morale, 
Welfare and Recreate (MWR) Boat Ramp at the USCG Base Elizabeth City located at 1664 
Weeksville Road, Elizabeth City, Pasquotank County, North Carolina. T~e geographic location 
of the MWR Boat Ramp is latitude 36 16' 14.72" north and longitude 76 10' 40.31" west. 

The USCG, Civil Engineering Unit (CEU) Cleveland, Environmental Section conducted a 
coastal zone management Federal consistency review of the proposed project and determined 
that the activities will be undertaken in a manner consistent, to the maximum extent practicable, 
with the enforceable policies of North Carolina's approved coastal management program. 

This correspondence provides your office with a proposed project description provided in 
Enclosure (1). The basis of the coastal zone determination is summarized in Enclosure (2). The 
proposed project Site Location Map and other supporting figures are presented in Enclosure (3). 
Enclosure (4) contains the Dredge Plan. In accordance with State guidance, the USCG has 
enclosed 15 CDs of this submittal in PDF format (Enclosure 5). 

The USCG requests your written concurrence with our consistency determination. If you have 
any questions, please contact Ms. Leilani Woods of my staff at (252) 335-6847. Alternatively, 
you may contact Ms. Jennifer Jones with our design firm (AECOM) at (919) 239-7150. 

or nter 
ief, Environmen I Compliance 

y direction of the Commanding Officer 

Encl: (I) Proposed Project Description 
(2) Basis of Determination 

JonesJ1
Text Box



                                                                 
 

 
  (3) Figures 1-9 
  (4) Dredge Plan – Existing Features 
  (5) 15 CDs of this USCG Consistency Determination Submittal 
 
Cc:  Ms. Leilani Woods, Environmental Engineer, USCG Civil Engineering Unit          

Cleveland 
  Ms. Jennifer Jones, Environmental Project Manager, AECOM  
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



                                                                 
 

 

 
 
 
 
 
 

ENCLOSURE (1) 
 

PROPOSED PROJECT DESCRIPTION 
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The U.S. Coast Guard (USCG) proposes to complete maintenance dredging of the existing boat 
basin and moorings at the Morale, Welfare and Recreate (MWR) Boat Ramp at the USCG Base 
Elizabeth City located at 1664 Weeksville Road, Elizabeth City, Pasquotank County, North 
Carolina.  The facility location is shown on the Site Location Map in Enclosure (3) Figure (1).  
The Dredge Plan, which depicts the dredge limits, is provided in Enclosure (4).   
 
The MWR Boat Ramp is located on the north end of the Base’s shoreline, in a portion of the 
river tidal flats.  The MWR Boat Ramp consists of a two-lane concrete ramp with a concrete 
pavement approach, and a launch dock centered in the boat ramp.  Rubble mound stone 
breakwaters project approximately 100 to 125 feet from the shoreline on both sides of the launch 
ramp to form a protected harbor area for launching and retrieving boats.  Timber docks line both 
sides of the boat basin.  Mooring piles are in place along the west timber dock.  Navigation aids 
are located near the entrance to the boat basin.  The project area is bounded by a timber dock, a 
breakwater and the Pasquotank River to the north; a timber dock, a breakwater and the 
Pasquotank River to the east; a launch dock, boat ramp and grass covered shoreline to the south; 
and a timber dock, a breakwater, and grass covered shoreline to the west followed by the 
Pasquotank River.    
 
The MWR Boat Ramp is utilized by Base military personnel for launching privately-owned 
recreational boats and for launching USCG vessels stationed at the Building 43 moorings.  The 
purpose of this project is to dredge the boat basin and moorings to a required depth below mean 
water level due to fluctuating conditions at the site.  Water depth in the boat basin and moorings 
is often reduced by heavy winds from the north, which push water from the boat basin and down 
the Pasquotank River.  This wind effect decreases the depth of the water and encumbers the 
USCG’s ability to utilize the existing boat ramp for both operational missions and recreational 
purposes.   
 
The MWR Boat Ramp is a previously dug man-made basin and the proposed dredging will occur 
entirely within the previously disturbed footprint of the boat basin and moorings.  However, the 
USCG has no record of the as-built drawings indicating the original dredge depth.  While the 
dredging required for the original construction of the MWR Boat Ramp likely disturbed the 
sediments to a depth proximate to the proposed dredge depth, the exact depth of the original 
dredging is not documented.  The proposed project represents the first maintenance dredging of 
the MWR Boat Ramp since its construction.  The construction date of the boat ramp is unknown.      
 
The proposed project involves mechanical dredging of the boat basin and moorings to a 
maximum depth of 8 feet below mean water level (includes one foot over dredge depth).  Mean 
water level corresponds to elevation -0.44 North American Vertical Datum 1988 (NAVD88).  
Therefore, dredging will proceed to -8.44 feet NAVD88.  The calculated dredge volume for the 
MWR Boat Ramp is 755 cubic yards of sediment.  The proposed dredging project will only 
temporarily impact open waters (an area totaling approximately 0.18 acres) and will occur 
entirely within the existing boat basin (limited to an area approximately 150 feet from the 
shoreline).     
 
The USCG has completed a pre-design hydrographic survey, sediment and elutriate sampling 
and analysis, and disposal site determination for the MWR Boat Ramp.  Major items of work that 



  Enclosure (1) 
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will be involved in the maintenance dredging of the MWR Boat Ramp boat basin and moorings 
at Base Elizabeth City and off-site disposal of the dredged material include the following: 
 

1. An approved registered surveyor will perform Pre-dredge and Post-dredge (before and 
after) soundings of area to be dredged including side slopes.  Drawings will be prepared 
showing the before and after sounding data.  Soundings will be taken within 15 days prior 
to the start of the dredging and within 3 days after completing all dredging.  Soundings 
will be taken at maximum 10-foot spacing along transects spaced no greater than 10 feet 
on center across the proposed dredge area (including side slopes).  Progress soundings or 
sweepings will also be taken behind the dredge as the work progresses.   

2. The registered surveyor will calculate the dredge quantity based on the before and after 
soundings.  The boat basin and moorings will be dredged to a maximum depth of 8 feet 
below mean water level (includes one foot over dredge depth).  Additional dredging may 
be necessary to remove any shoaling or sedimentation that has occurred since the May 7 
to 9, 2014 hydrographic survey included in the Design Drawings, and the “Before” 
hydrographic survey.   

3. The dredging will be accomplished using mechanical means.  The dredging will be 
performed from a floating plant and not from land based operations.  The dredge material 
will be deposited on barges, dewatered from the barge within the turbidity curtain, 
transported by barge to an unloading site, offloaded to trucks, and transported by truck to 
the approved East Carolina Regional Landfill in Aulander, North Carolina.  The dredge 
sediment material has been characterized as a non-hazardous waste and has been 
approved for disposal at the East Carolina Regional Landfill. 

4. Prior to commencing dredging operations, the proposed area for dredging will be 
enclosed with an impermeable floating turbidity curtain.  The curtain will be of a full 
depth floating design with weighted bottom edge.  The turbidity curtain will remain in 
place until dredging operations are completed and the final contracted depths have been 
verified.  The turbidity curtain will remain in place in accordance with permit conditions 
or for a period of 48 hours after completion of dredging, whichever occurs longer. 

Preliminary review indicates the dredging of the boat basin and mooring area will require 
approval from the Unites States Army Corps of Engineers (USACE) and the North Carolina 
Department of Environment and Natural Resources (NCDENR) Division of Water Resources 
(DWR).  The USACE and DWR have simplified the permitting process by allowing the 
submittal of a joint permit application to both agencies.  The joint permit application was 
submitted to the USACE and DWR on September 24, 2014.   
 
The dredge material will be disposed of at the East Carolina Regional Landfill located at 1922 
Republican Road in Aulander, Bertie County, North Carolina.  The landfill is approximately 63 
miles from Base Elizabeth City.  This landfill is a licensed and approved Subtitle D landfill 
permitted to accept special waste.  Formal approval for disposal of the dredge material at the 
MWR Boat Ramp has been received from the East Carolina Regional Landfill.  
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BASIS OF DETERMINATION 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



  Enclosure (2) 
BASIS OF DETERMINATION 

 
 

North Carolina Administrative Code 
Title 15a, Chapter 7, Coastal Management 

Subchapter 7H – State Guidelines for Areas of Environmental Concern 
  

Management Objectives 
 

1. Section .0205 Coastal Wetlands 

The USCG reviewed the U.S. Fish and Wildlife Service (USFWS) National Wetlands Inventory 
Map which did not identify wetlands in or near the project site.  However, the northern and 
northwestern portions of the project site and the remainder of the Pasquotank River are classified 
as Estuarine and Marine Deepwater (E1UBL), as shown in Enclosure (3) Figure (3).  The USCG 
reviewed the North Carolina Coastal Wetlands Map, which indicated that there are no coastal 
wetlands in or near the project site, as shown in Enclosure (3) Figure (2).  The proposed project 
will not have an effect on coastal wetlands, and is therefore consistent with this management 
objective.   

2. Section .0206 Estuarine Waters 

The proposed project site is located in the estuarine waters of the Pasquotank River, Elizabeth 
City, Pasquotank County as shown in Enclosure (3) Figure (1).  The proposed project will not 
impact the biological, social, aesthetic, and economic value of estuarine waters.  The proposed 
project is consistent with the management objectives in this rule because this project will prevent 
shoaling in the boat basin and moorings and will perpetuate social, recreational, and economic 
values. 

3. Section .0207 Public Trust Areas 

The proposed project will not be detrimental to the public trust rights and the biological and 
physical functions of the estuary or open coastal waters.  Interference with the use of the channel 
will be minimized during dredging activities.  Dredges will be shifted or moved or dredging 
operations will be interrupted to accommodate the movement of vessels and floating equipment, 
if necessary.  All spoils will be deposited and dewatered on the barges.  The dredging and 
dewatering operations will be conducted within an impermeable floating turbidity curtain.  The 
proposed project is consistent, to the maximum extent practicable, with the management 
objectives of public trust areas.    

4. Section .0208 Use Standards 

The proposed project is in conformance with the general and specific use standards of this 
section, and is therefore consistent with this management objective.   

5. Section .0209 Coastal Shorelines 

The project site is located adjacent to the estuarine shoreline and entirely within the Pasquotank 
River, as shown in Enclosure (3) Figure (2).  There are no High Quality Water/Outstanding 
Resource Water Management Zones at the proposed project site as shown in Enclosure (3) 
Figure (4).  Furthermore, the proposed project does not involve development or construction 
within the coastal shoreline.  The proposed project will not have an effect on estuarine and public 
trust shorelines, and is therefore consistent with the management objectives of coastal shorelines.  
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6. Section .0300 Ocean Hazard Areas 

The proposed project is not located along the Atlantic Ocean shoreline and contains no ocean 
hazard areas.  Therefore, the proposed project is consistent with this management objective. 

7. Section .0400 Public Water Supplies 

The proposed project site is located in the Pasquotank River Basin (sub basin 30-01-50).  The 
portion of the Pasquotank River where the project site is located (Index #: 30-3-(12)) is classified 
as “SB”, which is described as “Primary Recreation, Salt Water”.  The proposed project site is 
not located within a small surface water supply watershed or public water supply field.  The 
proposed project will not have an effect on public water supplies, and is therefore consistent with 
this management objective.   

8. Section .0505 Coastal Areas that Sustain Remnant Species 

The location of the proposed project site may affect, but is not likely to adversely affect, 
threatened and endangered species associated with the estuarine habitat of the Pasquotank River.  
As shown on the NC OneMap Habitat Map in Enclosure (3) Figure (5), there are no significant 
natural heritage areas in the vicinity of the project site; however, the project site is identified in a 
natural heritage element occurrence area.  Reviews of the NC OneMap Habitat Map; the North 
Carolina Division of Marine Fisheries (DMF) Anadromous Fish Spawning Areas (AFSA) map 
for the Albemarle Sound area (Enclosure (3) Figure (6)); the DMF Fishery Nursery Areas map 
(Enclosure (3) Figure (7)); the National Oceanic and Atmospheric Administration Environmental 
Sensitivity Map for the Elizabeth City Quadrangle; and the South Atlantic Fishery Management 
Council’s Essential Fish Habitat (EFH) Map (Enclosure (3) Figure (8)) indicate that the proposed 
project site is located within AFSA waters and in an area of EFH; however, the project site is not 
located in the vicinity of a designated submerged aquatic vegetation area, a primary nursery area, 
or an EFH-Habitat Area of Particular Concern.   

A review of the USFWS federally-listed species present in Pasquotank County, the USFWS 
Critical Habitat Mapper, and the North Carolina Natural Heritage Program (NHP) listed species 
for the Elizabeth City Quadrangle along with their habitat requirements was performed.  Several 
state and federally-listed rare, threatened and endangered species occur in Pasquotank County.  
According to the online resources there are three federally-listed species identified within 
Pasquotank County with potential habitat in the project area (Shortnose sturgeon, Acipenser 
brevirostrum; Atlantic sturgeon, Acipenser oxyrinchus; and West Indian manatee, Trichechus 
manatus).  Additionally, one federally-listed proposed threatened species (Red knot; Calidris 
canutus rufa) was identified within Pasquotank County and one state-listed threatened species 
(Bald eagle; Haliaeetus leucocephalus) was identified within the Elizabeth City quadrangle. 

Review of the online USFWS Information, Planning, and Conservation (IPaC) System indicates 
that only two of the endangered species (i.e., Shortnose sturgeon and Atlantic sturgeon) and the 
proposed threatened species (i.e., Red knot) should be considered in an effects analysis for the 
proposed project.  No critical habitats exist within the proposed project area.   

The USCG is in the process of preparing an Environmental Assessment (EA) for the project, and 
pursuant to the requirements of the National Environmental Policy Act (NEPA), the USCG will 
be consulting with the USFWS, NHP, DMF, the North Carolina Wildlife Resources Commission 
(WRC), and the National Marine Fisheries Service regarding the presence of natural resources 
that may be potentially affected by the proposed project.  
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Measures will be taken to avoid or minimize adverse impacts to natural and biological resources.  
The proposed dredging project will only temporarily impact open waters (an area totaling 
approximately 0.18 acres) and will occur entirely within the existing boat basin (limited to an 
area approximately 150 feet from the shoreline).  The dredging will be performed from a floating 
barge and not from land based operations.  Prior to commencing dredging operations, the 
proposed area for dredging will be closed with an impermeable floating turbidity curtain.  The 
turbidity curtain will remain in place in accordance with the permit conditions or for a period of 
48 hours following completion of the dredging, whichever occurs longer.  The dredge material 
will be dewatered on the barges within the turbidity curtain, transported by barge to an unloading 
site, offloaded, and transported by truck to an approved landfill.  The dredging will be limited to 
the area indicated on the Dredge Plan presented in Enclosure (4).   

Based on the project size and location and nature of the proposed work, the USCG does not 
anticipate significant adverse impacts to federally-listed species.  To avoid potentially adverse 
impacts on life cycles of anadromous fish, the proposed project is expected to occur outside of 
the anadromous fish spawning moratorium (February 15 to June 30).  Therefore, the USCG 
concludes that the proposed project may affect, but is not likely to adversely affect, any 
federally-listed threatened or endangered species or their habitats.  Additionally, since the 
proposed dredging will occur entirely within the previously disturbed footprint of the boat basin 
and moorings and the dredge depth is expected to be proximate to the original dredge depth, the 
project is not expected to have an adverse effect on any unique habitat conditions that would 
impact the continued survival of threatened and endangered native plants and animals.  The 
proposed project is consistent, to the maximum extent practicable, with this management 
objective. 

9. Section .0506 Coastal Complex Natural Areas 

The proposed project should not have an effect on: 

a. Natural conditions or the sites that function as key or unique components of 
coastal systems.   

b. The interactions of various life forms including sites that are necessary for the 
completion of life cycles, areas that function as links to other wildlife areas 
(wildlife corridors), and localities where the links between biological and physical 
environments are most fragile.   

c. Designated coastal complex natural areas.   

As shown on the NC OneMap Habitat Map in Enclosure (3) Figure (5), the project site is not 
located in a designated submerged aquatic vegetation area or a significant natural heritage area.  
According to the habitat map, the project site is identified in a shellfish growing area.  However, 
review of the NC DMF Shellfish Harvesting Area Closure Map (Enclosure (3) Figure (9)) 
indicates that the project site is located in a portion of the Pasquotank River where shellfish 
harvesting is prohibited (i.e., permanently closed).  Additionally, there are no state parks, state 
natural areas, or state recreation areas at the project site.  There are no national wildlife refuges, 
forests, historic properties, historic landmarks, national natural landmarks, no wild and scenic 
rivers, or other fragile areas at the project location.      

The proposed project site is located within a portion of the Pasquotank River designated as an 
AFSA (Conservation Planning Tool Rating of 8).  To avoid potentially adverse impacts on life 
cycles of anadromous fish, the proposed project is expected to occur outside of the anadromous 
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fish spawning moratorium (February 15 to June 30).  To avoid potentially adverse impacts to 
water quality, the proposed area for dredging will be closed with an impermeable floating 
turbidity curtain with a weighted bottom edge.  The dredge material will be dewatered on the 
barges within the turbidity curtain and the turbidity curtain will remain in place in accordance 
with the permit conditions or for a period of 48 hours following completion of the dredging, 
whichever occurs longer.  Therefore, the proposed project is not expected to have an adverse 
effect on designated coastal complex natural areas and is consistent, to the maximum extent 
practicable, with this management objective. 

10. Section .0507 Unique Coastal Geologic Formations 

The proposed project will not have an effect on any unique geologic formations, and is therefore 
consistent with this management objective.   

11. Section .0509 Significant Coastal Archaeological Resources 

The USCG has determined that there are no National Register-listed or –eligible, or potentially 
eligible (according to the North Carolina State Historic Preservation Office [NC SHPO] Study 
List) terrestrial or underwater archaeological sites located within or immediately adjacent to the 
proposed project site.  No previously identified shipwrecks or other underwater archaeological 
resources have been recorded in the proposed project site area. 

The proposed dredging activities will not create any subsurface disturbance that could affect 
terrestrial archaeological resources, if present.  Dredging will not be staged on the shore, and all 
dredged sediment will be loaded onto a barge.  Although maintenance dredging has not been 
previously conducted for the boat basin and moorings, the actions required for the original 
construction of the two-lane concrete ramp, launch dock, wooden piers, boat basin, and 
associated moorings have undoubtedly disturbed the sediments to a considerable depth.  Due to 
the extent of prior subsurface disturbance in the proposed project site, it is unlikely that intact, 
significant underwater archaeological resources would be present and retain integrity.  Therefore, 
the USCG has determined “No Historic Properties Affected.”  The USCG consulted with the NC 
SHPO regarding the determination and received concurrence from the NC SHPO which includes 
comments from the Office of State Archaeology. 

The proposed project will not have an effect on any significant coastal archaeological resources, 
and is therefore consistent with this management objective.   

12. Section .0510 Significant Coastal Historic Architectural Resources 

The USCG has determined that there are no National Register-listed or –eligible, or potentially 
eligible (according to the NC SHPO Study List) historic architectural resources located within or 
immediately adjacent to the proposed project site.  Three historic architectural resources have 
been identified within one mile of the proposed project site, including one site that has been 
Determined Eligible and two potentially eligible sites on the SHPO Study List.  The National 
Register-eligible site was photo documented and demolished in 2013 upon the SHPO’s approval.  
The two potentially eligible sites on the SHPO Study List are located inland, approximately one 
mile from the project site.  Therefore, the USCG has determined “No Historic Properties 
Affected.”  The USCG consulted with the NC SHPO regarding the determination and received 
concurrence from the NC SHPO. 

The proposed project will not have an effect on any significant coastal historic architectural 
resources, and is therefore consistent with the management objective.   
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13. Section .0600 - Development Standards Applicable to All AECs 

The proposed project will not contravene or violate any Federal, State of North Carolina, and 
local rules, regulations, laws, or requirements.  The proposed project will not cause pollution to 
the state shellfish waters, and will not have an effect on airspace activity or noise pollution 
associated with airspace activity.  Therefore, the proposed project is consistent with the 
management objectives of development standards applicable to all AECs. 

Subchapter 7M - General Policy Guidelines for the Coastal Area 

Policies for Projects Outside Areas of Environmental Concern 

1. Section .0200 - Shoreline Erosion Policies 

The proposed project will not have an adverse impact to shoreline erosion in the area, and is 
therefore consistent with the shoreline erosion policies.   

2. Section .0300 - Shorefront Access Policies 

The USCG Base Elizabeth City facility is a fenced and gated Federal facility that restricts public 
access.  Since public access is already restricted, the proposed project will not have an adverse 
impact on the accessibility of the facility’s shorefront to the public.  Therefore, the proposed 
project is consistent with the shorefront access policies. 

3. Section .0400 - Coastal Energy Policies 

The USCG facility and the proposed project are not associated with the development of energy 
facilities and energy resources.  Therefore, the proposed project is consistent with the coastal 
energy policies.   

4. Section .0500 - Post-Disaster Policies 

The proposed project does not involve construction; therefore, pre-disaster planning is not 
required.  This proposed project is therefore consistent with the post-disaster policies.   

5. Section .0600 - Floating Structure Policies 

The proposed project will involve the use of a floating plant and barges; however, the floating 
plant and barges are not considered “floating structures” as defined in Section .0602 since they 
will not be inhabited or used for commercial purposes for more than 30 days.  Therefore, the 
proposed project is consistent with the floating structure policies. 

6. Section .0700 - Mitigation Policy 

The proposed project will not have an adverse impact to coastal lands or waters which would 
require mitigation, and is therefore consistent with the mitigation policy.   

7. Section .0800 - Coastal Water Quality Policies 

The proposed project will not cause the degradation of water quality so as to impair traditional 
uses of the coastal waters.  No hazardous materials or petroleum products are expected to be 
discharged at the project location.  The proposed project does involve in-water dredging that will 
generate waste sediments; however, the dredge sediment material has been characterized as a 
non-hazardous waste and has been approved for offsite disposal at a licensed and approved 
Subtitle D landfill permitted to accept Special Waste (East Carolina Regional Landfill).  
Therefore, this proposed project is consistent with the coastal water quality policies.   
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8. Section .0900 - Policies on Use of Coastal Airspace 

The proposed project does not involve aviation or coastal airspace resources, and is therefore 
consistent with the coastal airspace policies.   

9. Section .1000 - Policies on Water and Wetland Based Target Areas for Military 
Training Activities 

The proposed project is not involved with military training activities, and is therefore consistent 
with this coastal policy.  

10.  Section .1100 - Policies on Beneficial Use and Availability of Materials Resulting from 
the Excavation or Maintenance of Navigational Channels 

The proposed project includes in-water dredging that will generate sediments requiring disposal; 
however, the material will not be dredged from the navigation channel.  Furthermore, previous 
sediment sampling indicates low concentrations of metals and polynuclear aromatic 
hydrocarbons may be present.  Therefore, the proposed project is consistent with this coastal 
policy.   

11. Section .1200 - Policies on Ocean Mining 

The proposed project does not include any mining activities, and is therefore consistent with the 
ocean mining policies.   

Conclusion 

The USCG conducted a coastal zone management Federal consistency review of the proposed 
project and determined that the proposed project will not have any significant impacts to the 
coastal resources.  Therefore, the proposed project is consistent, to the maximum extent 
practicable, with the enforceable policies of North Carolina's federally approved coastal 
management program.   

 
 

 
 



   

 
 
 
 
 
 

ENCLOSURE (3) 
 

FIGURES 1 – 9 
 

FIGURE (1): SITE LOCATION MAP 

FIGURE (2):  COASTAL WETLANDS MAP 

FIGURE (3): USFWS WETLANDS MAP 

FIGURE (4): WATER QUALITY MAP 

FIGURE (5): NATURAL HERITAGE AREAS/HABITAT MAP 

FIGURE (6): NCDMF ANADROMOUS FISH SPAWNING AREAS MAP 

FIGURE (7): NCDMF FISHERY NURSERY AREAS MAP 

FIGURE (8): SAFMC ESSENTIAL FISH HABITAT MAP 

FIGURE (9): NCDMF SHELLFISH HARVESTING CLOSURE MAP 
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Source: National Atlas.Gov 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Figure (1): Topographic Map – 1983  
Elizabeth City, NC Topographic Quadrangle 
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Figure (2): North Carolina Coastal Wetlands Map 
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Figure (3): USFWS Wetlands Map 
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Figure (4): NC OneMap Water Quality Map 
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Figure (5): NC OneMap Habitat Map 
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Figure (6): NC DMF Anadromous Fish Spawning Areas Map 
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Figure (7): NC DMF Fishery Nursery Areas Map 
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Figure (8): SAFMC Essential Fish Habitat Map 
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Figure (9): NC DMF Shellfish Harvesting Area Closure Map 
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DREDGE PLAN – EXISTING FEATURES 
 
 

FIGURE (10): DREDGE PLAN 
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Figure 10: Dredge Plan



AECOM    

 

J:\Projects\U\US Coast Guard 2013 Contract\Elizabeth City, NC\Sediment 
Sampling and EA\500 Deliverables\506 Reports\EA_MWR Boat 
Ramp\EA\MWR Boat Ramp_EA_DRAFT_03-13-15.docx 

                                                                                         March 2015 

 

Appendix D.  
 
Consultations with State and 
Federal Agencies 



 AECOM 919.854.6200 tel 
 701 Corporate Center Drive, Suite 475 919.854.6259 fax 
 Raleigh, NC  27607 
  

 

October 30, 2014 

 

Ms. Allison Weakley 
NC Office of Land and Water Stewardship 
NC Natural Heritage Program 
1601 Mail Service Center  
Raleigh, NC 27699-1601   
 

Subject:   U.S. Coast Guard Base Elizabeth City – Dredging at MWR Boat Ramp, Elizabeth 
City, North Carolina 

 
Dear Ms. Weakley: 

The U.S. Coast Guard (USCG) Civil Engineering Unit Cleveland is in the process of preparing an 
Environmental Assessment (EA) for proposed maintenance dredging of the boat basin and 
moorings at the Morale, Welfare and Recreate (MWR) Boat Ramp at the USCG Base Elizabeth 
City.  The USCG Base Elizabeth City is located approximately 3.5 miles southeast of Elizabeth City, 
along Highway 34, on the south shore of the Pasquotank River in Pasquotank County, North 
Carolina (Attachment A).  The geographic location of the MWR Boat Ramp is latitude 36° 16’ 
14.72” north and longitude 76° 10’ 40.31” west.   

The MWR Boat Ramp is a previously dug man-made basin and the proposed dredging will occur 
entirely within the previously disturbed footprint of the boat basin and moorings.  However, the 
USCG has no record of the as-built drawings indicating the original dredge depth.  While the 
dredging required for the original construction of the MWR Boat Ramp likely disturbed the 
sediments to a depth proximate to the proposed dredge depth, the exact depth of the original 
dredging is not documented.  Therefore, the USCG has elected to conduct an EA to address 
National Environmental Policy Act of 1969 requirements.  The EA will determine whether or not 
there is potential for significant impact to the human and natural environments.  Following 
completion of the EA, the USCG will either file a Finding of No Significant Impact or prepare an 
Environmental Impact Statement.  This letter provides the North Carolina Natural Heritage Program 
(NC NHP) with information on the boat ramp construction, existing environment, and proposed 
action in advance of issuance of the EA for this project.  The USCG would appreciate any 
comments the NC NHP may have for consideration in preparation of the EA.  

The MWR Boat Ramp is located on the north end of the Base’s shoreline, in a portion of the river 
tidal flats.  The MWR Boat Ramp consists of a two-lane concrete ramp with a concrete pavement 
approach, and a launch dock centered in the boat ramp (Attachments B and C).  Rubble mound 
stone breakwaters project approximately 100 to 125 feet from the shoreline on both sides of the 
launch ramp to form a protected harbor area for launching and retrieving boats.  Timber docks line 
both sides of the boat basin.  Mooring piles are in place along the west timber dock.  Navigation 
aids are located near the entrance to the boat basin.  These consist of a red dayboard with a solar-
powered red beacon, and a green dayboard.  The MWR Boat Ramp is utilized by base military 
personnel for launching privately-owned recreational boats, and for launching USCG vessels 
stationed at the Building 43 moorings.     

The purpose of this project is to dredge the boat basin and moorings to a required depth below 
mean water level at the MWR Boat Ramp due to changing conditions at the site.  Water depth in the 
boat basin and moorings is reduced by heavy winds from the north, which push water from the boat 
basin and down the Pasquotank River.  This wind effect decreases the depth of the water and 
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encumbers the USCG’s ability to utilize the existing boat ramp for both operational missions and 
recreational purposes.  The project involves mechanical dredging of the boat basin and moorings to 
a maximum depth of 8 feet below mean water level (includes 1 foot over dredge depth).  Mean 
water level corresponds to elevation -0.44 North American Vertical Datum 1988 (NAVD88).  
Therefore, dredging will proceed to -8.44 feet NAVD88.  The calculated dredge volume for the 
MWR Boat Ramp is 755 cubic yards of sediment.  The proposed dredging project will only 
temporarily impact open waters (an area totaling approximately 0.18 acres) and will occur entirely 
within the existing boat basin (limited to an area approximately 150 feet from the shoreline).  The 35 
percent civil site plan entitled, “Dredging at MWR Boat Ramp: CG Base Elizabeth City” illustrates 
the location and specifications of this proposed dredging project (Attachment D). 

During the proposed dredging activities, the dredge area will be closed with an impermeable floating 
turbidity curtain with a weighted bottom edge.  The dredge material will be deposited on barges, 
dewatered on the barges, transported by barge to an unloading site, offloaded to trucks, and 
transported by truck to the East Carolina Regional Landfill in Aulander, North Carolina for disposal.  
Formal approval for disposal of the dredge material at the MWR Boat Ramp has been received from 
the East Carolina Regional Landfill. 

The USCG has reviewed the U.S. Fish and Wildlife Service (USFWS) Threatened and Endangered 
Species and Species of Concern for Pasquotank County and the NC NHP listed species for the 
Elizabeth City Quadrangle along with their habitat requirements.  Table 1 is a list of rare, threatened 
and endangered species documented to occur in Pasquotank County and the Elizabeth City 
quadrangle where the project site is located (Attachment E).  The USCG also reviewed the 
USFWS Critical Habitat Mapper and the online USFWS Information, Planning, and Conservation 
(IPaC) System.   

According to the online resources there is one state-listed endangered species identified within the 
Elizabeth City quadrangle (Shortnose sturgeon; Acipenser brevirostrum) with potential habitat in the 
project area and two additional federally-listed endangered species (Atlantic sturgeon; Acipenser 
oxyrinchus and West Indian manatee; Trichechus manatus) identified within Pasquotank County 
with potential habitat in the project area.  One state-listed threatened species (Bald eagle; 
Haliaeetus leucocephalus) was also identified within the Elizabeth City quadrangle with potential 
habitat in the project area.  Additionally, one federally-listed proposed threatened species (Red 
knot; Calidris canutus rufa) was identified within Pasquotank County.  Review of the IPaC System 
indicates that only two of the endangered species (i.e., Shortnose sturgeon and Atlantic sturgeon) 
and the proposed threatened species (i.e., Red knot) should be considered in an effects analysis for 
the proposed project.  No critical habitats were identified within the proposed project area.   

The USCG requests that the NC NHP provide any additional information or potential concerns 
regarding the presence of threatened and endangered species or other significant natural resources 
that may be potentially affected by the maintenance dredging of the boat basin and moorings at the 
MWR Boat Ramp.  Any comments or recommendations that your agency may have for avoiding 
potential impacts associated with this project would also be appreciated.  We would appreciate 
receipt of your written approval within 30 days of this letter; this will help us maintain the overall 
schedule for this project. 
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If you have any questions, please contact Jennifer Jones (AECOM) at (919) 239-7150 or Leilani 
Woods (USCG) at (252) 335-6847. 

Yours sincerely, 
        

 

Jennifer Jones   Ron Johnson 
Environmental Task Manager  Senior Biologist 

 
Cc:  Ms. Leilani Woods, Environmental Engineer, USCG Civil Engineering Unit Cleveland 

 Mr. Greg Carpenter, Environmental Project Manager, USCG Civil Engineering Unit 
Cleveland 

 
Attachments: (A) Dredge Site - Location Map 

(B) Dredge Site - Aerial Photograph 
(C) Dredge Site - Ground-Level Photographs 
(D) Dredge Site – 35% Plan 
(E) Table 1 – Listing of Rare, Threatened and Endangered Species 
(F) References Cited 

  



 

 

ATTACHMENT (A) 

 

DREDGE SITE - LOCATION MAP 

 



Map Location

June 2014

Site Location Map
MWR Boat Ramp

USCG Base Elizabeth City, North Carolina

Figure 1

AECOM Environment
701 Corporate Center Drive, Suite 475
Raleigh, NC 27607
Phone: (919) 854-6200
Fax: (919) 854-6259
Web: http://www.aecom.com

0 1,000 2,000
Feet

±

NC

SC

VA

GA

TN

KY WV

Elizabeth City NC Topographic Quadrangle (1983)

Site Location

60321114



 

 

ATTACHMENT (B) 

 

DREDGE SITE – AERIAL PHOTOGRAPH 

 



Scale: Not To Scale (Source:  Google Earth© 2014)
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DREDGE SITE – GROUND-LEVEL PHOTOGRAPHS 

 



 PHOTOGRAPH LOG 

Facility Name:  
United States Coast Guard 

Site Location: 
MWR Boat Ramp – USCG Base Elizabeth City, NC 

Project No. 
60321114 

 

Photo No. 

1 
Date: 

05/7/14 

Direction Photo 
Taken: 
 
North 

Description: 
 
View from the southern 
side of the shore 
(concrete pavement 
approach) of the concrete 
ramp, docks, navigation 
aids, and light pedestals. 
 
 

 
Photo No. 

2 
Date: 

05/7/14 

Direction Photo 
Taken: 
 
Northwest 
 

Description: 
 
View from the concrete 
pavement approach along 
the southern shoreline.    
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DREDGE SITE – 35% PLAN 
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TABLE 1 – LISTING OF RARE, THREATENED AND 
ENDANGERED SPECIES 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



Table 1 - Rare, Threatenened and Endangered Species, Natural Communities, and Special Habitats 
Listed by the Natural Heritage Program in Elizabeth City Quadrangle and 

US Fish and Wildlife Service in Pasquotank County

Taxonomic Group Scientific Name Common Name
State 

Status

NCNHP 
Search by 

USGS 
Quadrangle

Federal 
Status

Federal 
Record 
Status

Listed in 
Pasquotank 

County? Habitat

Species

Bird Haliaeetus leucocephalus Bald Eagle T Historical BGPA *Current yes

mature forests near large bodies of water (for 
nesting); lakes and sounds (for foraging) [nesting 
sites only]

Bird Calidris  canutus  rufa Red Knot - - P *Current yes

migration stops along the Atlantic coast; principally 
found in marine and estuarine habitats; main food 
source is horseshoe crab eggs

Fish Acipenser brevirostrum Shortnose Sturgeon E Current E *Current yes

anadromous; prefer nearshore marine, estuarine, 
and riverine habitat of large river systems; migrate 
periodically into faster moving fresh water areas to 
spawn

Fish Acipenser oxyrinchus Atlantic Sturgeon SC Current E *Current yes

anadromous; migrate from estuarine and marine 
waters into freshwater in the spring and early 
summer to spawn; spawn in moderately flowing 
water in deep parts of large rivers; subadults and 
adults live in coastal waters and estuaries

Fish Anguilla  rostrata American Eel - - FSC *Current yes

catadromous; mature eels migrate from brackish 
and freshwater habitats in streams, large rivers, 
and estuaries to the ocean to spawn. Larvae 
develop in the ocean and the eel migrates 
upstream to estuaries and freshwater habitats as it 
matures.

Mammal Trichechus manatus West Indian Manatee - - E *Current yes warm waters of estuaries and river mouths

Vascular Plant Sagittaria  weatherbiana Grassleaf Arrowhead - - FSC **Historic yes
fresh or brackish marshes, streambanks, and wet 
depressions

Vascular Plant Boltonia asteroides var. glastifolia White Doll's-daisy SR-O Historical - - - clay-based Carolina bays, marshes, savannas
Vascular Plant Iris prismatica Slender Blue Iris SR-T Historical - - - bogs, marshes, and wet powerline clearings
Vascular Plant Ludwigia alata Winged Seedbox SR-P Historical - - - interdune ponds, marshes

Habitats

Natural Community -
Mesic Mixed Hardwood Forest 
(Coastal Plain Subtype) N/A Current N/A - - -

Natural Community -
Nonriverine Wet Hardwood 
Forest (Oak Flat Subtype) N/A Current N/A - - -

Natural Community -
Peatland Atlantic White Cedar 
Forest N/A Current N/A - - -

Natural Community -
Tidal Swamp (Cypress-Gum 
Subtype) N/A Current N/A - - -

Notes Federal Status:
E = Endangered
T = Threatened

FSC = Federal Species of Concern
BGPA = Bald and Golden Eagle Protection Act
P = Proposed

3. *Current record - the species has been observed in the county within the last 50 years. - = Not listed by USFWS in Pasquotank County
4. **Historic record - the species was last observed in the county more than 50 years ago. N/A = Not applicable

SR-P = Significantly Rare - Peripheral
SR-T = Significantly Rare - Throughout
- = Not listed by NCNHP in Elizabeth City quad
N/A = Not applicable

1. Current record - there is at least one record for the element in the region that has been 
seen recently.
2. Historical record - either the element has not been found in recent surveys in the 
region; or it has not been surveyed recently enough to be confident they are still present; 
or the occurreence is though to be destroyed.

State Status:
E = Endangered
T = Threatened

SC = Special Concern
SR-O = Significantly Rare - Other
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 November 13, 2014 
Ms. Jennifer Jones 
AECOM, Inc. 
701 Corporate Center Drive, Suite 475 
Raleigh, North Carolina 27607 
Jennifer.Jones@aecom.com 
 
RE: US Coast Guard Base – Dredging at the Morale, Welfare, and Recreate (MWR) Boat Ramp 
 Elizabeth City, Pasquotank County, North Carolina 
 
Dear Ms. Jones: 
 
Thank you for the opportunity to provide information from the North Carolina Natural Heritage Program 
(NCNHP) database for the proposed project referenced above. The NCNHP database does not show any 
records for rare species, important natural communities, natural areas, or conservation/managed areas 
within the proposed project area.  Within one mile of the proposed project area, the NCNHP database 
shows element occurrence records for the following rare species: 
 

SCIENTIFIC NAME COMMON NAME 

ELEMENT 
OCCURRENCE 
STATUS* ACCURACY 

STATE 
STATUS* 

FEDERAL 
STATUS* 

Acipenser brevirostrum Shortnose Sturgeon Current Very Low E E 
Acipenser oxyrinchus Atlantic Sturgeon Current Low SC E 
Iris prismatica Slender Blue Iris Historical Very Low SR-T --- 

* For status definitions, please see the Help document at http://www.ncnhp.org/web/nhp/database-search. 
 
The occurrence records for Shortnose Sturgeon and Atlantic Sturgeon are located in Albemarle Sound 
and North Carolina coastal waters (including Albemarle Sound), respectively.  The occurrence record for 
Slender Blue Iris is from Hogs Creek in Pasquotank County. 
 
Please note that although the NCNHP database may not show records for rare species within the 
proposed project area, it does not necessarily mean that they are not present; it may simply mean that 
the area has not been surveyed.  The use of Natural Heritage Program data should not be substituted for 
actual field surveys if needed, particularly if the project area contains suitable habitat for rare species.  
 
Feel free to contact me at 919-707-8629 or Allison.Weakley@ncdenr.gov if you have questions or need 
additional information. 
       Sincerely, 

        
       Allison Schwarz Weakley, Conservation Planner 
       NC Natural Heritage Program 

mailto:Jennifer.Jones@aecom.com�
http://www.ncnhp.org/web/nhp/database-search�
mailto:Allison.Weakley@ncdenr.gov�


 AECOM 919.854.6200 tel 
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 Raleigh, NC  27607 

 

October 29, 2014 

 

Mr. Pete Benjamin 
Field Supervisor 
U.S. Fish and Wildlife Service 
551F Pylon Drive 
Raleigh, NC 27606   

Subject:  U.S. Coast Guard Base Elizabeth City – Dredging at MWR Boat Ramp, Elizabeth 
City, North Carolina 

Dear Mr. Benjamin: 
 
The U.S. Coast Guard (USCG) Civil Engineering Unit Cleveland is in the process of preparing an 
Environmental Assessment (EA) for proposed maintenance dredging of the boat basin and 
moorings at the Morale, Welfare and Recreate (MWR) Boat Ramp at the USCG Base Elizabeth 
City.  The USCG Base Elizabeth City is located approximately 3.5 miles southeast of Elizabeth City, 
along Highway 34, on the south shore of the Pasquotank River in Pasquotank County, North 
Carolina (Attachment A).  The geographic location of the MWR Boat Ramp is latitude 36° 16’ 
14.72” north and longitude 76° 10’ 40.31” west.   

The MWR Boat Ramp is a previously dug man-made basin and the proposed dredging will occur 
entirely within the previously disturbed footprint of the boat basin and moorings.  However, the 
USCG has no record of the as-built drawings indicating the original dredge depth.  While the 
dredging required for the original construction of the MWR Boat Ramp likely disturbed the 
sediments to a depth proximate to the proposed dredge depth, the exact depth of the original 
dredging is not documented.  Therefore, the USCG has elected to conduct an EA to address 
National Environmental Policy Act of 1969 requirements.  The EA will determine whether or not 
there is potential for significant impact to the human and natural environments.  Following 
completion of the EA, the USCG will either file a Finding of No Significant Impact or prepare an 
Environmental Impact Statement.  This letter provides the U.S. Fish and Wildlife Service (USFWS) 
with information on the boat ramp construction, existing environment, and proposed action in 
advance of issuance of the EA for this project.  The USCG would appreciate any comments the 
USFWS may have for consideration in preparation of the EA.  

The MWR Boat Ramp is located on the north end of the Base’s shoreline, in a portion of the river 
tidal flats.  The MWR Boat Ramp consists of a two-lane concrete ramp with a concrete pavement 
approach and a launch dock centered in the boat ramp (Attachments B and C).  Rubble mound 
stone breakwaters project approximately 100 to 125 feet from the shoreline on both sides of the 
launch ramp to form a protected harbor area for launching and retrieving boats.  Timber docks line 
both sides of the boat basin.  Mooring piles are in place along the west timber dock.  Navigation 
aids are located near the entrance to the boat basin.  These consist of a red dayboard with a solar-
powered red beacon, and a green dayboard.  The MWR Boat Ramp is utilized by base military 
personnel for launching privately-owned recreational boats, and for launching USCG vessels 
stationed at the Building 43 moorings.   

The purpose of this project is to dredge the boat basin and moorings to a required depth below 
mean water level at the MWR Boat Ramp due to changing conditions at the site.  Water depth in the 
boat basin and moorings is reduced by heavy winds from the north, which push water from the boat 
basin and down the Pasquotank River.  This wind effect decreases the depth of the water and 
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encumbers the USCG’s ability to utilize the existing boat ramp for both operational missions and 
recreational purposes.  The project involves mechanical dredging of the boat basin and moorings to 
a maximum depth of 8 feet below mean water level (includes 1 foot over dredge depth).  Mean 
water level corresponds to elevation -0.44 North American Vertical Datum 1988 (NAVD88).  
Therefore, dredging will proceed to -8.44 feet NAVD88.  The calculated dredge volume for the 
MWR Boat Ramp is 755 cubic yards of sediment.  The proposed dredging project will only 
temporarily impact open waters (an area totaling approximately 0.18 acres) and will occur entirely 
within the existing boat basin (limited to an area approximately 150 feet from the shoreline).  The 35 
percent civil site plan entitled, “Dredging at MWR Boat Ramp: CG Base Elizabeth City” illustrates 
the location and specifications of this proposed dredging project (Attachment D). 

During the proposed dredging activities, the dredge area will be closed with an impermeable floating 
turbidity curtain with a weighted bottom edge.  The dredge material will be deposited on barges, 
dewatered on the barges, transported by barge to an unloading site, offloaded to trucks, and 
transported by truck to the East Carolina Regional Landfill in Aulander, North Carolina for disposal.  
Formal approval for disposal of the dredge material at the MWR Boat Ramp has been received from 
the East Carolina Regional Landfill. 

The USCG has reviewed the USFWS Threatened and Endangered Species and Species of 
Concern for Pasquotank County and the North Carolina Natural Heritage Program listed species for 
the Elizabeth City Quadrangle along with their habitat requirements.  Table 1 is a list of rare, 
threatened and endangered species documented to occur in Pasquotank County and the Elizabeth 
City Quadrangle where the project site is located (Attachment E).  The USCG also reviewed the 
USFWS Critical Habitat Mapper and the online USFWS Information, Planning, and Conservation 
(IPaC) System.   

According to the online resources, there are three federally-listed endangered species identified 
within Pasquotank County with potential habitat in the project area:  Shortnose sturgeon (Acipenser 
brevirostrum), Atlantic sturgeon (Acipenser oxyrinchus), and West Indian manatee (Trichechus 
manatus).  Additionally, one federally-listed proposed threatened species (Red knot; Calidris 
canutus rufa) and one protected species under the Bald and Golden Eagle Protection Act (Bald 
eagle; Haliaeetus leucocephalus) were identified within Pasquotank County.  Review of the IPaC 
System indicates that only two of the endangered species (i.e., Shortnose sturgeon and Atlantic 
sturgeon) and the proposed threatened species (i.e., Red knot) should be considered in an effects 
analysis for the proposed project.  No critical habitats were identified within the proposed project 
area.   

The USCG requests that the USFWS provide any additional information or potential concerns 
regarding the presence of threatened and endangered species that may be potentially affected by 
the maintenance dredging of the boat basin and moorings at the MWR Boat Ramp.  Any comments 
or recommendations that your agency may have for avoiding potential impacts associated with this 
project would also be appreciated.  We would appreciate receipt of your written approval within 30 
days of this letter; this will help us maintain the overall schedule for this project. 
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If you have any questions, please contact Jennifer Jones (AECOM) at (919) 239-7150 or Leilani 
Woods (USCG) at (252) 335-6847. 

 
Yours sincerely, 
 

  
Jennifer Jones   Ron Johnson 
Environmental Task Manager  Senior Biologist 

 
Cc:  Ms. Leilani Woods, Environmental Engineer, USCG Civil Engineering Unit Cleveland 
  Mr. Greg Carpenter, Environmental Project Manager, USCG Civil Engineering Unit 

Cleveland  
 

Attachments: (A) Dredge Site – Location Map 
(B) Dredge Site – Aerial Photograph 
(C) Dredge Site – Ground-Level Photographs 
(D) Dredge Site – 35% Plan 
(E) Table 1 – Listing of Rare, Threatened and Endangered Species 
(F) References Cited 
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DREDGE SITE – GROUND-LEVEL PHOTOGRAPHS 

 



 PHOTOGRAPH LOG 

Facility Name:  
United States Coast Guard 

Site Location: 
MWR Boat Ramp – USCG Base Elizabeth City, NC 

Project No. 
60321114 

 

Photo No. 

1 
Date: 

05/7/14 

Direction Photo 
Taken: 
 
North 

Description: 
 
View from the southern 
side of the shore 
(concrete pavement 
approach) of the concrete 
ramp, docks, navigation 
aids, and light pedestals. 
 
 

 
Photo No. 

2 
Date: 

05/7/14 

Direction Photo 
Taken: 
 
Northwest 
 

Description: 
 
View from the concrete 
pavement approach along 
the southern shoreline.    
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Table 1 - Rare, Threatenened and Endangered Species, Natural Communities, and Special Habitats 
Listed by the Natural Heritage Program in Elizabeth City Quadrangle and 

US Fish and Wildlife Service in Pasquotank County

Taxonomic Group Scientific Name Common Name
State 

Status

NCNHP 
Search by 

USGS 
Quadrangle

Federal 
Status

Federal 
Record 
Status

Listed in 
Pasquotank 

County? Habitat

Species

Bird Haliaeetus leucocephalus Bald Eagle T Historical BGPA *Current yes

mature forests near large bodies of water (for 
nesting); lakes and sounds (for foraging) [nesting 
sites only]

Bird Calidris  canutus  rufa Red Knot - - P *Current yes

migration stops along the Atlantic coast; principally 
found in marine and estuarine habitats; main food 
source is horseshoe crab eggs

Fish Acipenser brevirostrum Shortnose Sturgeon E Current E *Current yes

anadromous; prefer nearshore marine, estuarine, 
and riverine habitat of large river systems; migrate 
periodically into faster moving fresh water areas to 
spawn

Fish Acipenser oxyrinchus Atlantic Sturgeon SC Current E *Current yes

anadromous; migrate from estuarine and marine 
waters into freshwater in the spring and early 
summer to spawn; spawn in moderately flowing 
water in deep parts of large rivers; subadults and 
adults live in coastal waters and estuaries

Fish Anguilla  rostrata American Eel - - FSC *Current yes

catadromous; mature eels migrate from brackish 
and freshwater habitats in streams, large rivers, 
and estuaries to the ocean to spawn. Larvae 
develop in the ocean and the eel migrates 
upstream to estuaries and freshwater habitats as it 
matures.

Mammal Trichechus manatus West Indian Manatee - - E *Current yes warm waters of estuaries and river mouths

Vascular Plant Sagittaria  weatherbiana Grassleaf Arrowhead - - FSC **Historic yes
fresh or brackish marshes, streambanks, and wet 
depressions

Vascular Plant Boltonia asteroides var. glastifolia White Doll's-daisy SR-O Historical - - - clay-based Carolina bays, marshes, savannas
Vascular Plant Iris prismatica Slender Blue Iris SR-T Historical - - - bogs, marshes, and wet powerline clearings
Vascular Plant Ludwigia alata Winged Seedbox SR-P Historical - - - interdune ponds, marshes

Habitats

Natural Community -
Mesic Mixed Hardwood Forest 
(Coastal Plain Subtype) N/A Current N/A - - -

Natural Community -
Nonriverine Wet Hardwood 
Forest (Oak Flat Subtype) N/A Current N/A - - -

Natural Community -
Peatland Atlantic White Cedar 
Forest N/A Current N/A - - -

Natural Community -
Tidal Swamp (Cypress-Gum 
Subtype) N/A Current N/A - - -

Notes Federal Status:
E = Endangered
T = Threatened

FSC = Federal Species of Concern
BGPA = Bald and Golden Eagle Protection Act
P = Proposed

3. *Current record - the species has been observed in the county within the last 50 years. - = Not listed by USFWS in Pasquotank County
4. **Historic record - the species was last observed in the county more than 50 years ago. N/A = Not applicable

SR-P = Significantly Rare - Peripheral
SR-T = Significantly Rare - Throughout
- = Not listed by NCNHP in Elizabeth City quad
N/A = Not applicable

1. Current record - there is at least one record for the element in the region that has been 
seen recently.
2. Historical record - either the element has not been found in recent surveys in the 
region; or it has not been surveyed recently enough to be confident they are still present; 
or the occurreence is though to be destroyed.

State Status:
E = Endangered
T = Threatened

SC = Special Concern
SR-O = Significantly Rare - Other
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 AECOM 919.854.6200 tel 
 701 Corporate Center Drive, Suite 475 919.854.6259 fax 
 Raleigh, NC  27607 

 

October 29, 2014 

 

Ms. Shannon Deaton 
Habitat Conservation Program Manager 
North Carolina Wildlife Resources Commission 
Inland Fisheries 
1721 Mail Service Center  
Raleigh, NC 27699-1721  
 
 
Subject: U.S. Coast Guard Base Elizabeth City – Dredging at MWR Boat Ramp, Elizabeth 

City, North Carolina 

Dear Ms. Deaton: 
 
The U.S. Coast Guard (USCG) Civil Engineering Unit Cleveland is in the process of preparing an 
Environmental Assessment (EA) for proposed maintenance dredging of the boat basin and 
moorings at the Morale, Welfare and Recreate (MWR) Boat Ramp at the USCG Base Elizabeth 
City.  The USCG Base Elizabeth City is located approximately 3.5 miles southeast of Elizabeth City, 
along Highway 34, on the south shore of the Pasquotank River in Pasquotank County, North 
Carolina (Attachment A).  The geographic location of the MWR Boat Ramp is latitude 36° 16’ 
14.72” north and longitude 76° 10’ 40.31” west.   

The MWR Boat Ramp is a previously dug man-made basin and the proposed dredging will occur 
entirely within the previously disturbed footprint of the boat basin and moorings.  However, the 
USCG has no record of the as-built drawings indicating the original dredge depth.  While the 
dredging required for the original construction of the MWR Boat Ramp likely disturbed the 
sediments to a depth proximate to the proposed dredge depth, the exact depth of the original 
dredging is not documented.  Therefore, the USCG has elected to conduct an EA to address 
National Environmental Policy Act of 1969 requirements.  The EA will determine whether or not 
there is potential for significant impact to the human and natural environments.  Following 
completion of the EA, the USCG will either file a Finding of No Significant Impact or prepare an 
Environmental Impact Statement.  This letter provides the North Carolina Wildlife Resources 
Commission (NC WRC) with information on the boat ramp construction, existing environment, and 
proposed action in advance of issuance of the EA for this project.  The USCG would appreciate any 
comments the NC WRC may have for consideration in preparation of the EA.  

The MWR Boat Ramp is located on the north end of the Base’s shoreline, in a portion of the river 
tidal flats.  The MWR Boat Ramp consists of a two-lane concrete ramp with a concrete pavement 
approach and a launch dock centered in the boat ramp (Attachments B and C).  Rubble mound 
stone breakwaters project approximately 100 to 125 feet from the shoreline on both sides of the 
launch ramp to form a protected harbor area for launching and retrieving boats.  Timber docks line 
both sides of the boat basin.  Mooring piles are in place along the west timber dock.  Navigation 
aids are located near the entrance to the boat basin.  These consist of a red dayboard with a solar-
powered red beacon, and a green dayboard.  The MWR Boat Ramp is utilized by base military 
personnel for launching privately-owned recreational boats, and for launching USCG vessels 
stationed at the Building 43 moorings.   

The purpose of this project is to dredge the boat basin and moorings to a required depth below 
mean water level at the MWR Boat Ramp due to changing conditions at the site.  Water depth in the 
boat basin and moorings is reduced by heavy winds from the north, which push water from the boat 
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basin and down the Pasquotank River.  This wind effect decreases the depth of the water and 
encumbers the USCG’s ability to utilize the existing boat ramp for both operational missions and 
recreational purposes.  The project involves mechanical dredging of the boat basin and moorings to 
a maximum depth of 8 feet below mean water level (includes 1 foot over dredge depth).  Mean 
water level corresponds to elevation -0.44 North American Vertical Datum 1988 (NAVD88).  
Therefore, dredging will proceed to -8.44 feet NAVD88.  The calculated dredge volume for the 
MWR Boat Ramp is 755 cubic yards of sediment.  The proposed dredging project will only 
temporarily impact open waters (an area totaling approximately 0.18 acres) and will occur entirely 
within the existing boat basin (limited to an area approximately 150 feet from the shoreline).  The 35 
percent civil site plan entitled, “Dredging at MWR Boat Ramp: CG Base Elizabeth City” illustrates 
the location and specifications of this proposed dredging project (Attachment D). 

During the proposed dredging activities, the dredge area will be closed with an impermeable floating 
turbidity curtain with a weighted bottom edge.  The dredge material will be deposited on barges, 
dewatered on the barges, transported by barge to an unloading site, offloaded to trucks, and 
transported by truck to the East Carolina Regional Landfill in Aulander, North Carolina for disposal.  
Formal approval for disposal of the dredge material at the MWR Boat Ramp has been received from 
the East Carolina Regional Landfill. 

The USCG has completed background research and records review using various maps and 
available online sources for the site including, but not limited to: the North Carolina OneMap (NC 
OneMap) Habitat Map; the NC DMF Anadromous Fish Spawning Areas (AFSA) map for the 
Albemarle Sound area; the DMF Fishery Nursery Areas map; the National Oceanic and 
Atmospheric Administration Environmental Sensitivity Map for the Elizabeth City Quadrangle; and 
the South Atlantic Fishery Management Council’s Essential Fish Habitat (EFH) online map.  Based 
on the USCG’s review, the proposed project site is located within AFSA waters and in an area of 
EFH; however, the project site is not located in the vicinity of a designated submerged aquatic 
vegetation area, a primary nursery area, or an EFH-Habitat Area of Particular Concern.   

The USCG requests that the NC WRC provide any additional information or potential concerns 
regarding the presence of significant natural resources that may be potentially affected by the 
maintenance dredging of the boat basin and moorings at the MWR Boat Ramp.  Any comments or 
recommendations that your agency may have for avoiding potential impacts associated with this 
project would also be appreciated.  We would appreciate receipt of your written approval within 30 
days of this letter; this will help us maintain the overall schedule for this project. 

If you have any questions, please contact Jennifer Jones (AECOM) at (919) 239-7150 or Leilani 
Woods (USCG) at (252) 335-6847. 
 
Yours sincerely, 
 
 
  
Jennifer Jones   Ron Johnson 
Environmental Task Manager  Senior Biologist 

 
Cc:  Ms. Leilani Woods, Environmental Engineer, USCG Civil Engineering Unit Cleveland 
 Mr. Greg Carpenter, Environmental Project Manager, USCG Civil Engineering Unit 

Cleveland  
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Attachments: (A) Dredge Site - Location Map 
(B) Dredge Site - Aerial Photograph 
(C) Dredge Site - Ground-Level Photographs 
(D) Dredge Site – 35% Plan 
(E) References Cited 
 



 

 

ATTACHMENT (A) 

 

DREDGE SITE - LOCATION MAP 

 



Map Location

June 2014

Site Location Map
MWR Boat Ramp

USCG Base Elizabeth City, North Carolina

Figure 1

AECOM Environment
701 Corporate Center Drive, Suite 475
Raleigh, NC 27607
Phone: (919) 854-6200
Fax: (919) 854-6259
Web: http://www.aecom.com

0 1,000 2,000
Feet

±

NC

SC

VA

GA

TN

KY WV

Elizabeth City NC Topographic Quadrangle (1983)

Site Location

60321114



 

 

ATTACHMENT (B) 

 

DREDGE SITE – AERIAL PHOTOGRAPH 

 



Scale: Not To Scale (Source:  Google Earth© 2014)

Dredge Site -
Aerial Photograph

US Coast Guard
Base Elizabeth City – MWR Boat Ramp

Elizabeth City, NC

Attachment B

www.aecom.com



 

 

ATTACHMENT (C) 

 

DREDGE SITE – GROUND-LEVEL PHOTOGRAPHS 

 



 PHOTOGRAPH LOG 

Facility Name:  
United States Coast Guard 

Site Location: 
MWR Boat Ramp – USCG Base Elizabeth City, NC 

Project No. 
60321114 

 

Photo No. 

1 
Date: 

05/7/14 

Direction Photo 
Taken: 
 
North 

Description: 
 
View from the southern 
side of the shore 
(concrete pavement 
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Appendix E.  
 
State Historic Preservation Office 
Consultation 



 AECOM 919.854.6200 tel 
 701 Corporate Center Drive, Suite 475 919.854.6259 fax 
 Raleigh, NC  27607 
 

 

July 18, 2014 

 

Ms. Renee Gledhill-Earley  
State Historic Preservation Office 
4617 Mail Service Center  
Raleigh, NC 27699-4617   
 
SUBJECT:  U.S. Coast Guard Base Elizabeth City – Dredging at MWR Boat Ramp, Elizabeth City, 

North Carolina 
 
Dear Ms. Gledhill-Earley: 
 
In compliance with Section 106 of the National Historic Preservation Act (NHPA), the U.S. Coast Guard 
(USCG) Civil Engineering Unit Cleveland is initiating consultation with your office concerning the 
proposed action to complete dredging of the boat ramp and moorings at the Morale, Welfare and 
Recreate (MWR) Boat Ramp at the USCG Base Elizabeth City.  The USCG Base Elizabeth City is 
located approximately 3.5 miles southeast of Elizabeth City, along Highway 34, on the south shore of the 
Pasquotank River in Pasquotank County, North Carolina (Attachment A).  The geographic location of the 
MWR Boat Ramp is latitude 36° 16’ 14.72” north and longitude 76° 10’ 40.31” west.  The USCG has 
approved this consultation packet pursuant to 36 CFR 800.2(a)(3).  
 
The base is the largest USCG Air Station in the nation, and contains a number of commands - Air Station 
Elizabeth City, Aircraft Repair and Supply Center, Aviation Technical Training Center, Support Center 
Elizabeth City, and Small Boat Station Elizabeth City.  The base was established in 1940 and consists of 
over 100 buildings which have been constructed over the lifetime of the base.  The base occupies 
approximately 950 acres and most of the base’s buildings support the air command.  The base can be 
accessed either from the main gate off Weeksville Road on the north end of the base, or from a second 
entrance off Consolidated Road on the south end of the base.  The MWR Boat Ramp can be approached 
by water from the northeast or by land via Moukawsher Drive along the shoreline (Attachment B).   
 
The MWR Boat Ramp is located on the north end of the base’s shoreline, in a portion of the river tidal 
flats.  The MWR Boat Ramp consists of a two-lane concrete ramp with a concrete pavement approach, 
and a launch dock centered in the boat ramp.  Rubblemound stone breakwaters project approximately 
100 to 125 feet from the shoreline on both sides of the launch ramp to form a protected harbor area for 
launching and retrieving boats.  Timber docks line both sides of this protected harbor area.  Mooring piles 
are in place along the west timber dock.  Navigation aids are located near the entrance to the protected 
harbor area.  These consist of a red dayboard with a solar-powered red beacon, and a green dayboard 
(Attachment C).   

The MWR Boat Ramp is a two-lane concrete surface launch ramp utilized by base military personnel for 
launching privately-owned recreational boats, and for launching USCG vessels stationed at the Building 
43 moorings.  The purpose of this project is to dredge the boat basin and moorings to a required depth 
below Mean Water Low (MWL) datum at the MWR Boat Ramp in order for the unit’s small boats to transit 
and be able to execute their operational missions without the encumbrances of shoaling in the boat basin 
that they currently are experiencing due to specific wind directions at low tide.  Maintenance dredging has 
not previously been conducted at the MWR Boat Ramp.  The USCG anticipates conducting the proposed 
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Attachments: (A) Dredge Site - Location Map 
(B) Dredge Site - Aerial Photograph 
(C) Dredge Site - Ground-Level Photographs 
(D) Dredge Site – 35% Plan 
(E) Historic Preservation Office – Web GIS Maps 
(F) References Cited 

 

CC: Ms. Leilani Woods, Environmental Engineer, USCG Civil Engineering Unit Cleveland 
Mr. Greg Carpenter, Environmental Project Manager, USCG Civil Engineering Unit Cleveland
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North Carolina Department of Cultural Resources 

State Historic Preservation Office 
Ramona M. Bartos, Administrator 

Governor Pat McCrory                             Office of Archives and History  
Secretary Susan Kluttz                           Deputy Secretary Kevin Cherry 

Location: 109 East Jones Street, Raleigh NC 27601     Mailing Address: 4617 Mail Service Center, Raleigh NC 27699-4617   Telephone/Fax: (919) 807-6570/807-6599 
 

 
August 19, 2014 
 
Jennifer Jones 
AECOM 
701 Corporate Center Drive, Suite 475 
Raleigh, NC  27607 
 
Re: Dredge At MWR Boat Ramp, US Coast Guard Base, Elizabeth City, Pasquotank County, ER 14-1676 
 
Dear Ms. Jones: 

Thank you for your letter of July 18, 2014, concerning the above project. 

We have conducted a review of the project and are aware of no historic resources which would be affected by 
the project. Therefore, we have no comment on the project as proposed. 
 
The above comments are made pursuant to Section 106 of the National Historic Preservation Act and the 
Advisory Council on Historic Preservation’s Regulations for Compliance with Section 106 codified at 36 CFR 
Part 800. 
 
Thank you for your cooperation and consideration. If you have questions concerning the above comment, 
contact Renee Gledhill-Earley, environmental review coordinator, at 919-807-6579 or renee.gledhill-
earley@ncdcr.gov. In all future communication concerning this project, please cite the above referenced 
tracking number. 

Sincerely, 
 

 
Ramona M. Bartos 
 
 
 
 
 

mailto:renee.gledhill-earley@ncdcr.gov
mailto:renee.gledhill-earley@ncdcr.gov
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Pre‐Construction Notification (PCN) Form 

Project: USCG Base Elizabeth City – Dredging at the MWR Boat Ramp 

B. Project Information and Prior Project History    

3. Project Description 

3d. Explain the purpose of the proposed project: 

The purpose of the project is to dredge the boat basin and moorings to a required depth below Mean 

Water Low (MWL) to prevent the shoaling that the USCG is currently experiencing.  Water depth in the 

moorings is reduced by heavy winds from the north, which push water from the moorings and down the 

Pasquotank River.  This wind effect encumbers the USCG’s ability to transit, moor and execute 

operational missions.  The USCG military personnel launch privately‐owned recreational boats and USCG 

vessels stationed at the Building 43 moorings from the MWR Boat Ramp.  Maintenance dredging has not 

previously been conducted at the MWR Boat Ramp.  The MWR Boat Ramp is a previously dug man‐

made basin and the proposed dredge area will occur entirely within the previously dug boat basin and 

moorings.  There are no as‐built drawings available for the MWR Boat Ramp; therefore, the original 

depth of the boat basin is unknown.  Thus, the USCG is in the process of preparing an Environmental 

Assessment (EA) for the proposed dredging of the boat ramp to address NEPA requirements.  

3e. Describe the overall project in detail, including the type of equipment to be used: 

The project involves mechanical dredging of the boat basin and moorings at the MWR Boat Ramp to a 

maximum depth of 8 feet below MWL (includes one foot over dredge).  The calculated dredge volume 

for the MWR Boat Ramp is 755 cubic yards.  The proposed dredge area will be closed with an 

impermeable floating turbidity curtain with a weighted bottom edge.  The dredge material will be 

deposited on barges, dewatered on the barges (within the turbidity curtain), transported by barge to an 

unloading site, offloaded to trucks, and transported by truck to the East Carolina Regional Landfill for 

disposal. 

F. Supplementary Information 

5. Endangered Species and Designated Critical Habitat (Corps Requirement) 

5d. What data sources did you use to determine whether your site would impact Endangered Species or 

Designated Critical Habitat? 

The USFWS species list for Pasquotank County, USFWS Critical Habitat Mapper, NC Natural Heritage 

Program Data Search for the Elizabeth City quadrangle along with habitat requirements.   The USFWS 

Information, Planning, and Conservation (IPaC) System was also reviewed.  The USFWS (Raleigh field 

office) and the NC NHP will be consulted. 

According to the online resources there are three federally‐listed endangered species identified within 

Pasquotank County with potential habitat in the project area; Shortnose sturgeon (Acipenser 



brevirostrum), Atlantic sturgeon (Acipenser oxyrinchus), and West Indian manatee (Trichechus manatus).  

No critical habitats were identified within the proposed project area.  Review of the IPaC System 

indicates that only two of the endangered species (i.e., Shortnose sturgeon and Atlantic sturgeon) 

should be considered in an effects analysis for the proposed project.   

6. Essential Fish Habitat (Corps Requirement) 

6b. What data sources did you use to determine whether your site would impact Essential Fish Habitat? 

The South Atlantic Fishery Management Council’s (SAFMC) Essential Fish Habitat (EFH) online map was 

reviewed.  As part of the EA, the NC Division of Marine Fisheries will be consulted.  The NC Wildlife 

Resources Commission will also be consulted.  The NC OneMap Habitat Map, the National Oceanic and 

Atmospheric Administration (NOAA) Environmental Sensitivity Map for the Elizabeth City Quadrangle, 

and the NC DMF Anadromous Fish Spawning Area (AFSA) map for the Albemarle Sound area were also 

reviewed.  The proposed dredge area is located within AFSA waters; however, the project site is not 

located in the vicinity of a designated primary nursery area, submerged aquatic vegetation area, or an 

area of EFH. 
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North Carolina Department of Cultural Resources 

State Historic Preservation Office 
Ramona M. Bartos, Administrator 

Governor Pat McCrory                             Office of Archives and History  
Secretary Susan Kluttz                           Deputy Secretary Kevin Cherry 

Location: 109 East Jones Street, Raleigh NC 27601     Mailing Address: 4617 Mail Service Center, Raleigh NC 27699-4617   Telephone/Fax: (919) 807-6570/807-6599 
 

 
August 19, 2014 
 
Jennifer Jones 
AECOM 
701 Corporate Center Drive, Suite 475 
Raleigh, NC  27607 
 
Re: Dredge At MWR Boat Ramp, US Coast Guard Base, Elizabeth City, Pasquotank County, ER 14-1676 
 
Dear Ms. Jones: 

Thank you for your letter of July 18, 2014, concerning the above project. 

We have conducted a review of the project and are aware of no historic resources which would be affected by 
the project. Therefore, we have no comment on the project as proposed. 
 
The above comments are made pursuant to Section 106 of the National Historic Preservation Act and the 
Advisory Council on Historic Preservation’s Regulations for Compliance with Section 106 codified at 36 CFR 
Part 800. 
 
Thank you for your cooperation and consideration. If you have questions concerning the above comment, 
contact Renee Gledhill-Earley, environmental review coordinator, at 919-807-6579 or renee.gledhill-
earley@ncdcr.gov. In all future communication concerning this project, please cite the above referenced 
tracking number. 

Sincerely, 
 

 
Ramona M. Bartos 
 
 
 
 
 

mailto:renee.gledhill-earley@ncdcr.gov
mailto:renee.gledhill-earley@ncdcr.gov


 AECOM 919.854.6200 tel 
 701 Corporate Center Drive, Suite 475 919.854.6259 fax 
 Raleigh, NC  27607 
 

 

July 18, 2014 

 

Ms. Renee Gledhill-Earley  
State Historic Preservation Office 
4617 Mail Service Center  
Raleigh, NC 27699-4617   
 
SUBJECT:  U.S. Coast Guard Base Elizabeth City – Dredging at MWR Boat Ramp, Elizabeth City, 

North Carolina 
 
Dear Ms. Gledhill-Earley: 
 
In compliance with Section 106 of the National Historic Preservation Act (NHPA), the U.S. Coast Guard 
(USCG) Civil Engineering Unit Cleveland is initiating consultation with your office concerning the 
proposed action to complete dredging of the boat ramp and moorings at the Morale, Welfare and 
Recreate (MWR) Boat Ramp at the USCG Base Elizabeth City.  The USCG Base Elizabeth City is 
located approximately 3.5 miles southeast of Elizabeth City, along Highway 34, on the south shore of the 
Pasquotank River in Pasquotank County, North Carolina (Attachment A).  The geographic location of the 
MWR Boat Ramp is latitude 36° 16’ 14.72” north and longitude 76° 10’ 40.31” west.  The USCG has 
approved this consultation packet pursuant to 36 CFR 800.2(a)(3).  
 
The base is the largest USCG Air Station in the nation, and contains a number of commands - Air Station 
Elizabeth City, Aircraft Repair and Supply Center, Aviation Technical Training Center, Support Center 
Elizabeth City, and Small Boat Station Elizabeth City.  The base was established in 1940 and consists of 
over 100 buildings which have been constructed over the lifetime of the base.  The base occupies 
approximately 950 acres and most of the base’s buildings support the air command.  The base can be 
accessed either from the main gate off Weeksville Road on the north end of the base, or from a second 
entrance off Consolidated Road on the south end of the base.  The MWR Boat Ramp can be approached 
by water from the northeast or by land via Moukawsher Drive along the shoreline (Attachment B).   
 
The MWR Boat Ramp is located on the north end of the base’s shoreline, in a portion of the river tidal 
flats.  The MWR Boat Ramp consists of a two-lane concrete ramp with a concrete pavement approach, 
and a launch dock centered in the boat ramp.  Rubblemound stone breakwaters project approximately 
100 to 125 feet from the shoreline on both sides of the launch ramp to form a protected harbor area for 
launching and retrieving boats.  Timber docks line both sides of this protected harbor area.  Mooring piles 
are in place along the west timber dock.  Navigation aids are located near the entrance to the protected 
harbor area.  These consist of a red dayboard with a solar-powered red beacon, and a green dayboard 
(Attachment C).   

The MWR Boat Ramp is a two-lane concrete surface launch ramp utilized by base military personnel for 
launching privately-owned recreational boats, and for launching USCG vessels stationed at the Building 
43 moorings.  The purpose of this project is to dredge the boat basin and moorings to a required depth 
below Mean Water Low (MWL) datum at the MWR Boat Ramp in order for the unit’s small boats to transit 
and be able to execute their operational missions without the encumbrances of shoaling in the boat basin 
that they currently are experiencing due to specific wind directions at low tide.  Maintenance dredging has 
not previously been conducted at the MWR Boat Ramp.  The USCG anticipates conducting the proposed 
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Attachments: (A) Dredge Site - Location Map 
(B) Dredge Site - Aerial Photograph 
(C) Dredge Site - Ground-Level Photographs 
(D) Dredge Site – 35% Plan 
(E) Historic Preservation Office – Web GIS Maps 
(F) References Cited 

 

CC: Ms. Leilani Woods, Environmental Engineer, USCG Civil Engineering Unit Cleveland 
Mr. Greg Carpenter, Environmental Project Manager, USCG Civil Engineering Unit Cleveland
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DREDGE SITE - LOCATION MAP 

 



Map Location

June 2014

Site Location Map
MWR Boat Ramp

USCG Base Elizabeth City, North Carolina

Figure 1

AECOM Environment
701 Corporate Center Drive, Suite 475
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Fax: (919) 854-6259
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DREDGE SITE – AERIAL PHOTOGRAPH 

 



Scale: Not To Scale (Source:  Google Earth© 2014)

Dredge Site -
Aerial Photograph

US Coast Guard
Base Elizabeth City – MWR Boat Ramp

Elizabeth City, NC

Attachment B

www.aecom.com



 

 

ATTACHMENT (C) 

 

DREDGE SITE – GROUND-LEVEL PHOTOGRAPHS 

 



 PHOTOGRAPH LOG 

Facility Name:  
United States Coast Guard 

Site Location: 
MWR Boat Ramp – USCG Base Elizabeth City, NC 

Project No. 
60321114 

 

Photo No. 

1 
Date: 

05/7/14 

Direction Photo 
Taken: 
 
North 

Description: 
 
View from the southern 
side of the shore 
(concrete pavement 
approach) of the concrete 
ramp, docks, navigation 
aids, and light pedestals. 
 
 

 
Photo No. 

2 
Date: 

05/7/14 

Direction Photo 
Taken: 
 
Northwest 
 

Description: 
 
View from the concrete 
pavement approach along 
the southern shoreline.    
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DREDGE SITE – 35% PLAN 
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HISTORIC PRESERVATION OFFICE –  

WEB GIS MAPS 
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Republic Services, Inc.
18500 N. Allied Way, Phoenix, AZ 85054

 
 

SPECIAL WASTE DEPARTMENT DECISION

 
Waste Profile #
30261412720

Expiration Date
7/30/2015

 

I. Decision Request: Initial       Recertification       Change  

Disposal Facility: 3026 - East Carolina Regional Landfill

Generator Name: USCG Base Elizabeth City

Generator Site Address: 1664 Weeksville Road

City: Elizabeth City County: State: NC Zip:

Name of Waste: Dredge Material

Estimated Annual Volume: 755 Cubic Yards

II. Special Waste Department Decision:          Approved       Rejected  

Management Method(s):            Landfill       Solidification       Bioremediation       Transfer Facility

Problematic Special Waste according to Republic?             Yes            No

If yes, which one?          

Approved by Special Waste Review Committee?                Yes            No            Not Applicable

Precautions, Conditions or Limitations on Approval

This waste must be able to pass a paint filter test prior to shipment and disposal.
Free liquids are not permitted for landfill disposal.

 

Special Waste Analyst Signature: ____________________________            Name (Printed):  Suzanne Glass

Date: 7/30/2014

III. Facility Decision: Approved       Rejected

Precautions, Conditions or Limitations on Approval

By signing below, the General Manager or Designee agrees that a fully executed Special Waste Service Agreement is on file for this profile and that the
special waste file is complete.

 

General Manager or Designee: _____________________________                    Name (Printed): _____________________________

Date: 7/30/2014

pstanley




SPECIAL WASTE PROFILE

pril 3

I. Generator Information 

II. Billing Information

III. Waste Stream Information

ONGOING

IV. Representative Sample Certification

 

e Date

Sample ID Numbers:

3026 East Carolina Regional LF NC

USCG Base Elizabeth City

1664 Weeksville Road

Elizabeth City Pasquotank North Carolina 27909

n/a n/a n/a

1664 Weeksville Road

Elizabeth City North Carolina 27909

Peter R. Carroll, CDR Peter.R.Carroll@uscg.mil

(216) 902-6204 (216) 902-6277

TBD

Dredged Material

Dredged sediment material at the MWR Boat Ramp at the USCG Base Elizabeth City. The sediment material is dredged
to prevent shoaling. The material is generated through natural deposition along the Pasquotank River. The material is
not generated through an industrial or manufacturing process.

✔

✔

✔

755 Cubic Yards

✔

✔

✔

05/15/2014

✔

MWR-1
MWR-2

30261412720

512



30261412720



 

 

About AECOM 
 
AECOM is a premier, fully integrated professional and 
technical services firm positioned to design, build, 
finance and operate infrastructure assets around the 
world for public- and private-sector clients. With nearly 
100,000 employees — including architects, engineers, 
designers, planners, scientists and management and 
construction services professionals — serving clients in 
over 150 countries around the world, AECOM is ranked 
as the #1 engineering design firm by revenue in 
Engineering News-Record magazine’s annual industry 
rankings. The company is a leader in all of the key 
markets that it serves, including transportation, 
facilities, environmental, energy, oil and gas, water, 
high-rise buildings and government. AECOM provides a 
blend of global reach, local knowledge, innovation and 
technical excellence in delivering customized and 
creative solutions that meet the needs of clients’ 
projects. A Fortune 500 firm, AECOM companies, 
including URS Corporation and Hunt Construction 
Group, have annual revenue of approximately $19 
billion. 
 
More information on AECOM and its services can be 
found at www.aecom.com. 
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